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City of Tulsa

Purchasing Division, 200 Civic Center

Tulsa, OK  74103

918-596-7563

Compilation Sheet




        









Lights, Sirens & Accessories

Bid 00-06 (Re-Bid)





  
  

    
    





    Police Department

Opening Date:  October 19, 2000
SECTION 1

Light Bars:






            McLoughlin
Emergency
Cruiser

Adamson
BELSCO,
               Law Enforcement 









& Eardley        Vehicle Equipment
  Tech

Industries
Inc.         

Equipment 
Item
Qty


Description






(1)
60
2001 Ford Crown Victoria light bar/directional



arrow bar package:




No Bid

$999.01

No Bid

$1,381.00
$1,420.88       
$885.76

(2)
15
2001 Chevrolet Impala light bar/directional arrow 



bar package:





No Bid

$999.01

No Bid

$1,381.00
$1,420.88
$885.76
Additional Items:

(3)
50
Red lens





No Bid

$11.20

No Bid

$18.00

$16.88

$10.87
(4)
50
Blue lens





No Bid

$11.20

No Bid

$18.00

$16.88

$10.87

(5)
75
Clear lens





No Bid

$11.20

No Bid

$18.00

$16.88

$10.87

(6)
25
SignalMaster directional light, eight bulb/reflector/



lens, model SML8, all amber lens, rear directional



light, complete with model SMC3 control, complete



with mounting hardware to attach to Federal Vector



light bars, item Z8572176B



No Bid

$434.95

No Bid

$580.00

$652.51

$380.21
(7)
25
Mounting brackets for 2001 Ford Police Interceptor,



Model #HK-CV92.




No Bid

$17.02

No Bid

$23.00

$25.88

$16.68

Behind the Grille Siren Driver/Mounting Brackets:  (Federal Signal DynaMax or equal, 100 Watt compact speaker delivering class “A” sound.

(8)
95
To fit 2001 Ford Crown Victoria



_______

$122.00

$120.00*
$181.00

$203.63

$119.46



(MS100-04 or acceptable equal)

(9)
25
To fit 2001 Chevrolet Impala



_______

$122.00

$120.00*
$181.00

$203.63

$119.46



(MS100-07 or acceptable equal)

SECTION 2

Siren/Light Bar Controls:

(1)
50
Unitrol TM4 Siren/Light Bar with Radio module,



LM10 and Siren Kill module.  Complete unit.

$595.80

$560.00

No Bid

$806.00

$906.75

$548.93

(2)
50
Unitrol Neutral Siren Kill Module, UPKM-1, for 



Ford Crown Victoria.




$22.92

$23.04

$37.80

$31.00

$34.88

$21.11

(3)
20
Unitrol Neutral Siren Kill Module, UPKM-1 for



Chevrolet Impala.




$22.92

$23.04

$37.80

$31.00

$34.88

$21.11

(4)
95
Unitrol Headlight Flasher, Kit #U131, (or 



acceptable equal.) for Ford Crown Victoria.

$35.86

$35.25

$25.54*

$48.00

$54.00

$33.76

(5)
25
Unitrol Headlight Flasher, Kit #FA4C/RDG (or 



acceptable equal.) for Chevrolet Impala.


$35.86

$35.25

$74.50*

$49.00

$55.13

$34.47

Additional Siren/Light Bar Items:

(To be purchased in lots of 5 or more)

(6)
5
Temperature Sensor:  Interior Temperature 



sensing unit (k-9 units) UTAS



$19.95

$20.00

No Bid

$27.00

$30.38

$19.00

(7)
5
Headlight Flasher Kits:  Unitrol #U131 or acceptable



equal.






$35.95

$35.25

$25.54*

$48.00

$54.00

$33.76

(8)
5
Headlight Flasher Kits:  Unitrol #FA4C-RDG or



acceptable equal.




$35.95

$35.25

$74.50*

$49.00

$55.13

$34.47

(9)
5
Siren Kill Module for 2001 Ford, #UPKM-1.

$35.95

$23.04

$37.80

$31.00

$34.88

$21.81

(10)
5
Siren Kill Module for 2001 Chevrolet Impala.

$35.95

$23.04

$37.80

$31.00

$34.88

$21.81



UPKM-1.

*Cruiser Tech bidding the following:  Section 1, Items 8 & 9:  CAST SH4020.  Section 2, Item 4 & 7:  Sound Off ETRROO-P.  Section 2, Item 5 & 8:  Sound Off ETHIMPO. 

Whelen Engineering “No Bid” all items except Section 1, item 8 (Whelen SA314P with SABKT2, $94.89 ea.) and Section 1, item 9, (Whelen SA314P With SABKT3, $94.89 ea.)

If you have questions or comments concerning this bid compilation, please contact Patricia Cummings by phone at 918-596-7561 or by E-Mail at pcummings@ci.tulsa.ok.us.
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