	City of Tulsa Purchasing Division - Bid Summary       

Bid: 00-108

Description: Apple computers and related equipment

Date of Opening: October 19, 2000


	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	PC Connection
	CCIT
	GTSI
	Custom Computer Specialists
	Apple Computer
	Multiwave
	Megabyte Business Systems

	Item 
	Qty
	Description


	Total
	Total
	Total
	Total
	Total
	Total
	Total

	1
	4
	Apple desktop
	$ 9344.00
	$ 9528.00
	$ 9804.00
	$ 10124.48
	$ 11620.00
	No Bid
	$ 13728.00

M7893LL/A

	2
	1
	Apple desktop
	$ 2604.00
	$ 2751.00
	$ 2763.00
	$ 2845.32
	$ 3715.00
	No Bid
	$ 3764.00

M7893LL/A & KTA-G4/256

	3
	4
	Apple monitor
	$ 992.00
	$ 1920.00
	$ 1568.00
	$ 1903.08

M770ZM/A
	$ 1796.00
	No Bid
	$ 1960.00

	4
	1
	Sony monitor
	$ 1087.00
	$ 1081.00
	$ 1132.00
	$ 1108.29
	No Bid
	$ 1065.00
	$ 1158.00

	5
	6
	Apple desktop
	$ 6126.00
	$ 5910.00
	$ 6498.00
	$ 6703.02
	$ 6552.00
	No Bid
	$ 6672.00

M7706LL/A & KTA-IMAC 100/64

	6
	1
	Apple laptop
	$ 1606.00
M772166/A
	$ 1774.00
	$ 1856.00
	$ 2010.77
	$ 2061.00
	No Bid
	$ 1904.00 

M7716LL/A & MIBOOK/64

	7
	1
	Adapter
	$ 64.00
	$ 64.00
	$ 67.00
	$ 66.12
	$ 62.00
	No Bid
	$ 68.25

	8
	1
	Zip drive
	$ 153.00
	$ 147.00
	$ 164.00
	$ 150.31
	$ 179.00
	$ 159.00
	$ 168.00

	9
	6
	Hub
	$ 318.00
	$ 336.00
	$ 336.00
	$ 369.84

F5U010-MAC
	$ No Bid
	No Bid
	$ 348.00

	10
	2
	Zip drive
	$ 454.00
	$ 464.00
	$ 470.00
	$ 462.36
	$ 458.00
	$ 470.00
	$ 480.00

	11
	1
	HP 1220cxi printer
	$ 452.00
	$ 467.00
	$ 451.00
	$ 470.07
	$ 515.00
	$ 486.00
	$ 462.00

	12
	3
	HP 812C printer
	$ 429.00

 840C
	$ 435.00
	$ 591.00

840C
	$ 453.57
	No Bid
	$ 528.00
	$ 438.00

	13
	1
	Apple server software
	$ 425.00
	$ 427.00
	No bid
	No Bid
	$ 19.95
	No Bid
	No Bid

	14
	1
	Applecare technician training
	$ 255.00
	$ 280.00
	$ 264.00
	$ 269.35
	$ 239.00
	No Bid
	$ 270.00

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	$ 24,309.00
	$ 25584.00
	$ 25964.00 +
	$ 26936.58 +
	$ 27,216.95 +
	$ 2708.00 +
	$ 31420.25 +


Note: Line item 12 will not be purchased at this time. A different printer will be selected.

 Prepared by:    Bill Youngblood                              

