	City of Tulsa Purchasing Division - Bid Summary       

Bid: 07-4001                                                                                           

Description: Defibrillators
Date of Opening: 4-30-08


	Physio-Control, Inc.
	Bound Tree Medical
	Zoll Medical

	Item
	Description (see technical specifications)
	QTY
	Unit Cost
	Extended Delivered Cost
	Unit Cost
	Extended Delivered Cost
	Unit Cost
	Extended Delivered Cost

	1
	99400-003505 Defibrillator  
	2
	14,781.10
	29,562.20
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	2
	11171-000017 LNCS DCI, Adult SpO2 Sensor reusable.


	2
	229.50
	459.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	3
	11171-000024 LNC4 Patient Cable, 4 ft.


	2
	124.95
	249.90
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	4
	11996-000025 – Large Adult Cuff, 16x42cm reusable, for NIBP.


	2
	24.65
	49.30
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	5
	11996-000023 Small Cuff 16x30cm reusable, for NIBP.


	2
	21.25
	42.50
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	6
	11998-000063 Removable Acrylic Screen


	2
	35.70
	71.40
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	7
	11260-000030 Basic Carrying Case for LP12.


	2
	212.50
	425.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	8
	11260-000029 Back Pouch for carrying case.


	2
	58.65
	117.30
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	9
	11220-000028 Top Pouch for carrying case.


	2
	39.10
	78.20
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	10
	11141-000026 LIFEPAK 12 NiCd battery, 2.4 amp hour capacity.


	8
	227.80
	1,822.40
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	11
	99407-000002 LIFEPAK 12 Battery support system 2 (charger/conditioner).


	2
	1,517.25
	3,034.50
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	
	Total delivered cost:
	
	
	35,911.70
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid


Prepared By: Elisabeth Hine
