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City of Tulsa

Purchasing Division, 200 Civic Center

Tulsa, OK  74103

918-596-7563

Compilation Sheet




        


Irrigation Parts and Supplies

TAC 253







     

     Park Department

Opening Date:  August 3, 2000







 AMC 

OTI

Water

Water 











Store

Products

1. All Rainbird Wholegoods in category III
   51%

No Bid

49.6%

No Bid

2. All Rainbird Wholegoods in category V
   51%

No Bid

49.6%

No Bid

3. All Rainbird Wholegoods in category VIII
   51%

No Bid

49.6%

No Bid

4. All Rainbird Repair Parts


   30%

No Bid

40.1%

No Bid

5. All Toro Wholegoods in Sales Code A
   51%

30% golf
51.3% 

No Bid

50% res/com

6. All Toro Wholegoods in Sales Code B
   40%

0

40.0%

No Bid

7. All Toro Repair Parts


   30%

0

40.0%

No Bid

8. All Weathermatic Wholegoods

   52.5%
No Bid

51.3%

No Bid

9. All Weathermatic Repair Parts

   30%

No Bid

40.0%

No Bid

10. Skinner R38 series, 2” thru 6”, repair couplings  10%

35%

22.0%

No Bid

11. Skinner R40 series, 2” thru 8”, repair couplings  15%

35%

22.0%

No Bid

12. Harco Ductile Iron Fittings, size 2”-6”
      30%
35%

22.0%

35%

Section 2  (Bid Cost Per Item)

1. Spears Item #5815-01012


$19.00

$16.90

$15.42

$30.38



1”mipt x 1”Brass Fipt x 12” nipple

2. Spears Item #5857-01012


$16.20

$17.10

$13.15

$26.73

1”mipt x 1”mipt x 12” nipple

3. Spears Item #5857-01512


$24.20

$24.54

$19.63

$39.42

1-1/2”mipt x 1-1/2”mipt x 12” nipple

4. Carson 910-12 Valve Box & Lid

No Bid

$6.70

$6.47

$12.00

5. Carson 1419-12 Valve Box & Lid

No Bid

$11.34

$11.23

$26.00

6. Carson 1220-12 Valve Box & Lid

No Bid

$23.86

$20.79

$12.00

7. Scotchlock 3570 Epoxy Wire Connector Kits
$1.25 

$1.47

$1.14

$2.15

8. Wilkins 720a 1” PVB


$50.00

$65.00

$49.28

$62.65

9. Wilkins 720a 1-1/2” PVB


$124.00
$159.36
$118.50
$155.00


10. Wilkins 720a 2” PVB


$143.00
$164.40
$137.01
$160.00

11. Wilkins 975 1” RPA



$102.65
$135.25
$98.70

$125.45

12. Wilkins 975 1-1/2” RPA


$213.80
$243.44
$195.30
$223.85

13. Wilkins 975 2” RPA



$228.00
$357.18
$219.33
$251.42

14. “HotBox” HB1 w/heater


$408.00
$408.50
$457.79
No Bid

15. “HotBox” HB1.5  w/heater


$550.00
$551.00
$594.81
No Bid

16. “HotBox HB2 w/heater


$565.00
$565.25
$608.51
No Bid

17. Matco 10RT  2” Square nut valve

$63.00

$73.15

$66.53

$62.75

18. Matco 100RT  3” Square nut valve

$102.00
$106.15
$113.75
$100.84

19. Matco 100RT  4” Square nut valve

$111.00
$141.24
$126.36
$109.75

20. Matco 100RT  6” Square nut valve

$194.00 
$229.90
$247.45
$192.29

If you have questions or comments concerning this bid compilation, please contact Patricia Cummings by phone at 918-596-7561 or by E-Mail at pcummings@ci.tulsa.ok.us.
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