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CITY OF TULSA

Purchasing Division, 200 Civic Center

Tulsa, OK  74103

918-596-7563

COMPILATION SHEET

TAC 355, PLUMBING SUPPLIES

CITY OF TULSA

Opening Date:  January 27, 2000

SECTION I - PLUMBING TOOLS AND ACCESSORIES

PIPE JOINT COMPOUNDS 

   Robertson
     Marico
            Ferguson

      Empire
DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Pipe Dope w/Teflon - 1 oz.
$1.39
POA

$1.78

Pipe Dope - 2 oz.
$0.96
POA

$0.64

Pipe Dope w/Teflon - 4 oz.
$4.55
POA
$2.76
$3.04

Pipe Joint Compound - 1/2 pt.
$4.50
$1.84

$5.23

Plumber’s Putty - 1/2 pt.
$0.81
$1.47

$0.90

Epoxy Putty - 4 oz.
$3.59
$4.20
$4.12
$4.36

Teflon Tape - 1/2” x 260”
$0.55
$0.30
$0.18
$0.27

Teflon Tape 1/2” x 520”
$0.55
$0.50
$0.23
$0.31


PIPE PRIMERS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Purple Primer NSF - 4 oz.
$0.95
POA

$0.67

Purple Primer NSF - 8 oz.
$1.38
POA
$1.92
$1.74

Purple Primer NSF - 16 oz.
$2.34
$5.55
$3.28
$2.37







PIPE CEMENTS
            

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

ABS Cement - 4 oz.
$1.09
$1.84

$1.03

ABS Cement - 8 oz.
$1.76
$2.59

$1.42

PIPE CEMENTS, CON’T.
ROBERTSON
MARICO
FERGUSON
EMPIRE

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

ABS Cement - 16 oz.
$3.11
$3.97

$2.22

ABS Cement - 32 oz.
$5.72
$6.07

$3.66

PVC Cement Reg. - 4 oz.
$0.93
$1.64
$1.37
$0.81

PVC Cement Reg. - 8 oz.
$1.39
$2.19
$1.69
$1.22

PVC Cement Med. - 8 oz.
$1.90
POA

$1.56

PVC Cement Reg. - 16 oz.
$2.30
$3.95
$2.92
$2.54

PVC Cement Med. - 16 oz.
$3.14
POA
$3.90
$2.70

PVC Cement Heavy - 32 oz.
$5.57
$7.48
$6.50
$5.98

CPVC Cement - 4 oz.
$1.75
$2.08

$1.34

CPVC  Cement - 8 oz.
$3.96
$3.15
$2.38
$2.06

PVC Cement - 4 oz.
$0.93
$1.59

$0.81

PVC Cement - 8 oz.
$1.39
$2.56
$1.69
$1.22

PVC Cement - 16 oz.
$2.30
$4.99
$2.92
$2.54

DRAIN CLEANING TOOLS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

1/4 X 25 Canister Auger.
$15.82
$11.47

$15.55

1/4 x 25 Drain Auger.
$24.43
$5.55

$15.55

7/16 x 3 Toilet Auger.
$15.95
POA
$19.79
$37.42

5” Force Cup Plunger
$1.99
$2.76
$4.00
$2.54

6” Force Cup Plunger
$3.96
$3.45
$1.99
$3.74

SOLDER AND ACCESSORIES

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

#5 Paste Flux - 1/2 oz.
$1.10
POA

$0.94

#5 Paste Flux - 2 oz.
$1.01
$1.64

$0.94

#5 Paste Flux - 1 lb.
$3.59
$4.51
$4.24
$3.81

#11 Tinning Flux - 4 oz.
$2.95
$POA

$2.90

#95 Lead-Free Tn. Flux - 2 oz.
$1.49
$2.36

$1.30

#95 Lead Free Tn. Flux - 8 oz.
$4.29
POA

$4.24

Instant Paste Solder - 1 1/2 oz.
$2.99
POA

$1.65

95/5 Sld Wire Solder - 1 lb.
$6.79
$9.33
$4.33
$5.34

Ld Free Plumbing Sldr - 1 oz.
$no bid
POA

$0.96

Ld Free Plumbing Sldr - 1/4 lb.
$no bid
POA

$2.80

Ld Free Plumbing slddr - 1/2 lb.
$no bid
POA

$3.32

Ld Free Plumbing Slddr - 1 lb.
$5.59
$8.88
$6.10
$6.12

Ld Free Plumbing Sldr Kit - 4 oz.
$no bid
$27.10

$2.98

Tubing Brush - 1/2”
$2.23
$5.02
$1.03
$1.10

Tubing Brush - 3/4”
$2.31
$5.52
$1.07
$1.14

Acid Brush
$0.10
$0.20
$0.93
$0.06

SOLDER & ACCESSORIES, CON’T.
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Emery Cloth - 1-1/2” x 15’
$3.72
$2.27
$3.20
$3.50

Silver Solder Kit - 1 oz.
$1.15
POA

$2.38

60/40 Rosin Core Sldr - 1/2 oz.
$no bid
$1.02
$11.22
$1.02

40/60 Rosin Core Sldr - 1/4 lb.
$no bid
$9.83
$8.73
$1.63

40/60 Acid Core Sldr - 1-1/2 oz.
$no bid
POA

$1.65

40/60 Acid Core Solder - 1/4 lb.
$no bid
POA

$1.63

40/60 Acid Core Solder - 1/2 lb.
$no bid
POA

$2.04

40/60 Acid Core Solder - 1 lb.
$no bid
$9.83

$3.34

PLUMBING TOOLS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Deluxe Tubing Cutter
$19.32
$10.96
$20.94
$22.35

Mini-Tubing Cutter
$3.13
$3.85
$20.17
$15.48

Adj. Cock Nut Wrench
$9.29
POA
$24.58
$16.15

Faucet Seat Wrench
$2.31
$2.76

$2.46

Basin Wrench
$4.76
$8.35

$22.63

Disposer Wrench
$4.38
$3.77

$0.60

Nipple Extractor
$2.38
$2.96

$14.61-3/4”         $9.57-1/2”

SECTION II - COPPER PIPE & FITTINGS

PIPE

DESCRIPTION
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE EACH
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE EACH

Type M Copper Pipe - 1/2 x 10
$0.37 
$5.75
$0.55
$3.80

Type M Copper Pipe - 3/4 x 10
$0.59 
$9.25
$0.87
$6.20

Type L Copper Pipe - 1/2 x 10
$0.53 
$8.60
$0.77
$5.50

Type L  Copper Pipe - 3/4 x 10
$0.82 
$12.65
$1.21
$8.60

Type L Soft Copper Tube - 1/4 x 60
$0.30
$28.20
$0.45
$18.60

Type L Soft Copper Tube - 3/8 x 60
$0.47 
$43.20
$0.70
$29.40

Type L Soft Copper Tube - 1/2 x 60
$0.59 
$54.60
$0.88
$37.20

Type L Soft Copper Tube - 3/4 x 60
$0.94 
$85.80
$1.37
$58.80

TEES

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Tee CXCXC - 1/2
$0.29
$0.37
$0.44
$0.34

Tee CXCXC - 3/4
$0.63
$0.92
$1.09
$0.86

Tee CXCXC - 3/4 x 3/4 x 1/2
$0.58
$0.84
$1.00
$0.78

TEES, CON’T.
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Tee CXCXC - 3/4 x 1/2 x 3/4
$0.72
$0.63
$1.21
$0.96

Tee CXCXC - 3/4 x 1/2 x 1/2
$0.76
$0.63
$1.21
$0.96

Drop-Eared Tee CXCXF - 1/2
$1.42
$3.13
$2.90
$5.37

CTS Brnz Comprsn Tee - 3/8 CTS
$3.10
POA
$1.32
$3.43

CTS Brnz Comprsn Tee - 1/2 CTS
$3.93
POA
$1.98
$3.43

ELBOWS





DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

90o  Elbow CXC - 1/2
$0.17
$0.26
$0.27
$0.21

90o  Elbow CXC
?


?

90o  Elbow CXC - 3/4
$0.37
$0.50
$0.56
$0.46

90o  Elbow CXC
?


?

90o  Elbow CXC - 3/4 x 1/2
$1.01
$1.16
$1.37
$1.08

90o  Elbow CXC - 1/2
$0.17
$0.23
$0.27
$0.21

90o  Elbow CXC - 3/4
$0.37
$0.50
$0.56
$0.46

45o  Elbow CXC - 1/2
$0.29
$0.39
$0.46
$0.36

45o  Elbow CXC - 3/4
$0.49
$0.67
$0.79
$0.62

45o  Street Elbow CXC - 1/2
$0.35
POA
$0.53
$0.42

45o  Street Elbow CXC - 3/4
$0.51
POA
$0.81
$0.64

Drop-Eared Elbow CXF - 1/2
$1.36
$2.40
$1.91
$1.50

Drop-Eared Elbow CXF - 3/4
$2.05
$4.11
$3.25
$3.87

COUPLINGS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Coupling w/Stp CXC - 1/2
$0.13
$0.17
$0.20
$0.15

Coupling w/Stp CXC - 1/2
$0.13
$0.17
$0.20
$0.15

Coupling w/Stp CXC 1/2 x 1/4
$0.25
$0.36
$0.43
$0.33

Coupling w/Stp CXC - 1/2 x 3/8
$0.25
$0.33
$0.39
$0.31

Coupling w/Stp CXC - 3/4
$0.25
$0.33
$0.39
$0.31

Coupling w/Stp CXC - 3/4
$0.25
$0.33
$0.39
$0.31

Coupling w/Stp CXC - 3/4 x 1/2
$0.44
$0.57
$0.68
$0.54

Fitting Reducer FTGXC - 1/2 x 1/4
$0.29
$0.38
$0.45
$0.33

Fitting Reducer FTGXC - 3/4 x 1/2
$0.41
$0.57

$0.54

Fitting Reducer FTGXC - 1 x 3/4
$0.65
$0.92
$1.09
$0.86

Coupling No-Stop CXC - 1/2
$0.17
$0.20
$0.24
$0.19

Coupling No-Stop CXC - 3/4
$0.34
$0.45
$0.53
$0.42

Brnz Comprsn Coupling - 3/8 CTS
$1.70
POA
$0.60
$2.44

Brnz Comprsn Coupling - 1/2 CTS
$3.10
POA
$0.92
$2.88

Female Adapter CXF
$0.49


$0.64

COUPLINGS, CONT.
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Female Adapter CXF - 1/2 x 3/4
$1.06
$1.52
$1.79
$1.41

Female Adapter CXF - 3/4
$0.66
$0.96
$1.14
$0.88

Female Adapter CXF - 3/4 x 1
$2.62
$3.24
$3.83
$3.02

Female Adapter CXF - 3/4 x 1/2
$1.26
$1.52
$1.79
$1.40

Male Adapter CXM - 1/2
$0.35
$0.47
$0.56
$0.44

Male Adapter CXM - 1/2 x 3/4
$0.88
$1.29
$1.53
$1.20

Male Adapter CXM - 3/4
$0.54
$0.79
$0.93
$0.73

Male Adapter CXM - 3/4 x 1
$2.96
$2.82
$3.34
$2.62

Male Adapter CXM - 3/4 x 1/2
$0.95
$1.29
$1.53
$1.20

UNIONS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Union CXC - 1/2
$1.99
$2.18
$2.76
$2.17

Union CXC - 3/4
$2.39
$2.73
$3.47
$2.72

Dielectric Union FIPXC - 1/2
$2.28
$4.62
$2.14
$2.01

Dielectric Union FIPXC - 3/4
$2.49
$4.62
$2.20
$2.08

HANGERS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Tube Strap w/Nail - 1/2
$0.06
$0.25
$0.06
$0.07

Tube Strap w/Nail - 3/4
$0.08
$0.39
$0.08
$0.09

Copper Pipe Hanger - 1/2 x 6
$0.08
POA

$0.07

Copper Pipe Hanger - 3/4 x 6
$0.09
POA

$0.07

Copper J Nail - 1/2
$0.07
$1.22
$0.07
$0.05

Copper J Nail - 3/4
$0.08
$1.22
$0.10
$0.05

MISCELLANEOUS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Bushing FTGXC - 1/2 x 3/8
$0.34
$0.45
$0.81
$0.34

Bushing FTGXC - 3/4 x 1/2
$0.48
$0.81
$1.47
$0.58

Tube Cap C - 1/2
$0.14
$0.15
$0.18
$0.14

Tube Cap C - 3/4
$0.22
$0.27
$0.32
$0.25

SECTION III - FLARE & COMPRESSION FITTINGS

HANDI COILS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Handicoil Cpr Tubing - 1/4 x 10
$0.29 
POA

$3.10

Handicoil Cpr Tubing - 1/4 x 20
$0.29
POA

$6.20

HANDI COILS, CON’T.
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Handicoil Cpr Tubing - 3/8 x 10
$0.47
POA

$4.90

Handicoil Cpr Tubing - 3/8 x 20
$0.47
POA

$9.80

Handicoil Cpr Tubing - 1/2 x 10
$0.60
POA

$6.20

Handicoil Cpr Tubing - 1/2 x 20
$0.60
POA

$12.40

Handicoil Cpr Tubing - 5/8 x 10
$0.68
POA

$8.10

Handicoil Cpr Tubing - 5/8 x 20
$0.68
POA

$16.20

REFRIGERATION TUBING





DESCRIPTION
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Rfrgn Cpr Tubing - 1/4 x 50
$12.34 per roll
$18.50
$18.18 Per roll
$12.50

Rfrgn Cpr Tubing - 1/4 x 1
$0.29 per foot
POA

$0.25

Rfrgn Cpr Tubing - 3/8 x 50
$19.50 per roll
$21.00
$27.03 Per roll
$19.00

Rfrgn Cpr Tubing - 3/8 x 1
$0.47 per foot
POA

$0.38

Rfrgn Cpr Tubing - 1/2 x 50
$24.00 per roll
$26.00
$34.66 per roll
$24.50

Rfrgn Cpr Tubing - 1/2 x 1
$0.60 per foot
POA

$0.49

TYPE L. TUBING

DESCRIPTION
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE EACH
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE EACH

Type L Cpr Tubing - 1/4 x 60
$0.30
$28.20
$0.45
$18.60

Type L Cpr Tubing - 3/8 x 60
#0.47
$43.20
$0.70
$29.40

Type L Cpr Tubing - 1/2 x 60
$0.59
$54.60
$0.88
$37.20

Type L Cpr Tubing - 3/4 x 60
$0.94
$85.80
$1.38
$58.80

Type L Cpr Tubing - 3/4 x 1
$1.14
POA
$1.38
$58.80

FLARE CAPS, NUTS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Flare Cap - 1/4
$0.16
$0.19
$0.14
$0.16

Flare Cap - 3/8
$0.25
$0.32
$0.21
$0.24

Flare  Cap - 1/2
$0.29
$0.49
$0.26
$0.30

Flare Cap - 5/8
$0.68
$0.74
$0.54
$0.64

Short Flare Nut - 1/4
$0.15
$0.40
$0.14
$0.16

Short Flare Nut - 3/8
$0.24
$0.49
$0.22
$0.24

Short Flare Nut - 1/2
$0.34
$0.62
$0.32
$0.31

Short Flare Nut - 5/8
$0.46
$0.89
$0.46
$0.50

FLARE UNIONS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Flare Union - 1/4
$0.25
$$0.34
$0.19
$0.23

Flare Union - 3/8
$0.39
$0.60
$0.32
$0.37

Flare Union - 1/2
$0.57
$0.91
$0.49
$0.56

FLARE UNIONS, CON’T.
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
Price Each
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Flare Union - 5/8
$0.71
$1.52
$0.79
$0.91

Reducing Flr Union - 3/8 x 1/4
$0.56
$0.75

$0.42

Reducing Fir Union - 1/2 x 3/8
$0.57
$1.10

$0.62

Fir x Fml Pipe Union - 3/8 x 1/4
$0.47
$0.57
$0.38
$0.36

Fir x Fml Pipe Union - 3/8 x 3/8
$0.45
$0.77
$0.40
$0.43

Fir x Fml Pipe Union - 3/8 x 1/2
$0.59
$0.92
$0.50
$0.55

Fir x Fml Pipe Union - 1/2 x 1/2
$0.66
$1.10
$0.53
$0.61

Fir x Fml Pipe Union - 5/8 x 1/2
$0.72
$1.29
$0.63
$0.73

Fir x Fml Pipe Union - 5/8 x 3/4
$1.03.
$1.73
$0.84
$0.97

Fir x Male Pipe Union - 1/4 x 1/4
$0.26
$0.34
$0.21
$0.25

Fir x Male Pipe Union - 3/8 x 3/8
$0.33
$0.60
$0.32
$0.34

Fir x Male Pipe Union - 3/8 x 1/2
$0.47
$0.79
$0.48
$0.52

Fir x Male Pipe Union - 1/2 x 1/2
$0.49
$0.87
$0.52
$0.56

Fir x Male Pipe Union - 1/2 x 3/4
$0.94
$1.50
$0.80
$0.88

Fir x Male Pipe Union - 5/8 x 1/2
$0.59
$1.10
$0.60
$0.24

Fir x Male Pipe Union - 5/8 x 3/4
$0.99
$1.52
$0.89
$1.03

FLARE TEES

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
Price Each
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Flare Tee- 1/4
$0.67
$1.33
$0.94
$0.72

Flare Tee - 3/8
$1.04
$1.51
$1.25
$0.94

Flare Tee - 1/2
$1.15
$1.99
$1.91
$1.41

Flare Tee - 5/8
$1.77
$3.52
$2.96
$1.80

FLARED MALE ELBOWS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Fir x Male Pipe Elbow - 1/4 x 1/4
$0.81
$1.00
$0.87
$0.68

Fir x Male Pipe Elbow - 3/8 x 1/4
$0.81
$1.10
$0.80
$0.72

Fir x Male Pipe Elbow - 3/8 x 3/8
$0.89
$1.12
$1.09
$0.74

Fir x Male Pipe Elbow - 3/8 x 1/2
$1.11
$1.51
$1.36
$0.96

Fir x Male Pipe Elbow - 1/2 x 1/2
$1.29
$1.63
$1.48
$1.20

Fir x Male Pipe Elbow - 5/8 x 1/2
$1.38
$2.03
$2.05
$1.43

COMPRESSION SLEEVES, NUTS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Compression Sleeve - 1/4
$0.04
$0.04
$0.03
$0.03

Compression Sleeve - 3/8
$0.05
$0.06
$0.10
$0.10

Compression Sleeve - 1/2
$0.07
$0.12
$0.12
$0.14

Compression Sleeve - 5/8
$0.10
$0.14
$0.14
$0.19

Compression Sleeve - 7/8
$0.28
$0.28
$0.34
$0.38

COMPRESSION SLEEVES, NUTS CON’T
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Compression Nut - 1/4
$0.08
$0.12
$0.08
$0.09

Compression Nut - 3/8
$0.11
$0.16
$0.12
$0.12

Compression Nut - 1/2
$0.21
$0.34
$0.24
$0.23

Compression Nut - 5/8
$0.28
$0.38
$0.35
$0.40

Compression Nut - 7/8
$0.88
$1.03
$0.60
$0.69

COMPRESSION UNIONS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Compression Union - 1/4
$0.38
$0.59
$0.45
$0.46

Compression Union - 3/8
$0.49
$0.76
$0.57
$0.59

Compression Union - 1/2
$0.81
$1.28
$0.87
$0.90

Compression Union - 5/8
$0.96
$1.66
$0.97
$1.00

Compression Union - 7/8
$2.69
$3.21
$3.10
$3.20

Reducing Comp Union - 3/8 x 1/4
$0.56
$0.75

$0.82

Reducing Comp Union - 1/2 x 3/8
$0.89
$1.14

$0.91

Reducing Comp Union - 5/8 x 3/8
$0.94
$1.68

$1.02

Reducing Comp Union - 5/8 x 1/2
$1.59
$1.76

$1.55

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 1/4 x 1/4
$0.59
$0.77
$0.57
$0.55

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 3/8 x 1/4
$0.48
$0.89
$2.93
$0.54

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 3/8 x 3/8
$0.49
$0.79
$0.52
$0.54

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union 3/8 x 1/2
$0.61
$0.86
$0.65
$0.68

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 1/2 x 3/8
$0.76
$1.08
$0.82
$0.84

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 1/2 x 1/2
$0.72
$1.21
$0.88
$0.91

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 5/8 x 1/2
$0.91
$1.55
$1.03
$1.07

Cmp x Male Union - 3/8 x 1/4
$0.36
$0.59
$0.37
$0.49

Cmp x Male Union - 1/4 x 1/4
$0.32
$0.49
$0.36
$0.37

Cmp x Male Union - 1/4 x 1/8
$0.28
$0.46
$0.29
$0.30

Cmp x Male Union - 3/8 x 1/2
$0.55
$0.85
$0.65
$0.67

Cmp x Male Union - 3/8 x 3/8
$0.42
$0.76
$0.47
$0.49

Cmp x Male Union - 1/2 x 1/2
$0.65
$1.05
$0.71
$0.74

Cmp x Male Union - 1/2 x 3/8
$0.57
$0.98
$0.63
$0.84

Cmp x Male Union - 5/8 x 1/2
$0.69
$1.24
$0.81
$0.84

Cmp x Male Union - 7/8 x 3/4
$1.89
$2.05
$1.98
$2.04

COMPRESSION TEES
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Compression Tee- 1/4
$0.81
$1.42
$0.87
$0.90

Compression Tee - 3/8
$1.14
$1.83
$1.26
$1.30

Compression Tee - 1/2
$2.18
$3.44
$1.88
$2.18

Compression Tee - 5/8
$2.75
$4.00
$3.09
$3.20

COMPRESSION ELBOWS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Compression Elbow - 1/4
$0.95
$1.33

$0.59

Compression Elbow - 3/8
$0.89
$1.47

$1.02

Compression Elbow - 1/2
$1.56
$2.61

$1.66

Compression Elbow - 5/8
$1.62
$2.78

$2.45

Cmp x Male Elbow - 3/8 x 1/2
$1.03
$1.79
$1.22
$1.60

Cmp x Male Elbow - 1/2 x 3/8
$1.49
$1.75
$1.31
$1.94

Cmp x Male Elbow - 1/2 x 1/2
$1.49
$2.20
$1.58
$2.36

Cmp x Male Elbow - 5/8 x 1/2
$1.88
$2.74
$1.63
$1.70

Cmp x Male Elbow - 1/4 x 1/4
$0.55
$1.06
$0.56
$0.59

Cmp x Male  Elbow - 1/4 x 1/8
$0.55
$0.77
$0.50
$0.52

Cmp x Male Elbow - 3/8 x 1/8
$0.99
$1.14
$0.72
$0.73

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 3/8 x 3/8
$0.47
$0.79
$0.99
$0.54

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union 3/8 x 1/2
$0.56
$0.86
$1.22
$0.68

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 1/2 x 3/8
$0.73
$1.08
$1.31
$0.84

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 1/2 x 1/2
$0.68
$1.21
$0.84
$0.91

Cmp x Fm Pipe Union - 5/8 x 1/2
$0.89
$1.55
$1.03
$1.07

Cmp x Male Union - 3/8 x 1/4
$0.35
$0.59

$0.49

Cmp x Male Union - 1/4 x 1/4
$0.33
$0.49
$0.36
$0.37

SECTION IV - DRAIN, WASTE & VENT PIPE & FITTINGS

DRAIN, WASTE & VENT PIPE

DESCRIPTION
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE EACH
PRICE PER FOOT
PRICE PER FOOT

DWV Pipe - 1-1/2 x 10
$0.30
$2.80
$0.33
$0.31

DWV Pipe - 1/2 x 20
$0.30
$2.05
$0.33
$0.31

DWV Pipe - 2 x 10
$0.39
$3.70
$0.44
$0.41

DWV Pipe - 2 x 20
$0.39
$5.40
$0.44
$0.41

DWV Pipe - 3 x 10
$0.74
$7.20
$0.91
$0.84

DWV Pipe - 3 x 20
$0.74
$14.40
$0.91
$0.84

DWV Pipe - 4 x 10
$1.01
$10.30
$1.29
$1.15

DWV Pipe 4 x 20
$1.01
$20.60
$1.29
$1.15

TEES
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Test Tee - 2
$1.81
$3.20
$2.33
$1.92

Test Tee - 3
$3.32
$5.41
$4.66
$3.86

Sanitary Tee - 2 x 1-1/2
$0.73
$0.98
$0.93
$0.78

Sanitary Tee - 2 x 1-1/2 x 1

POA
$1.33
$0.97

Sanitary Tee - 3/4 x 3/4 x 1/2

POA
$0.19
$0.19

Sanitary Tee - 3 x 3 x 1-1/2
$1.12
$1.99
$1.90
$1.57

Sanitary Tee - 4 x 4 x 2
$4.96
$6.70
$6.41
$5.31

Sanitary Tee - 3 x 3 x 2
$1.19
$2.12
$2.03
$1.68

Sanitary Tee 3 x 3 x 3 x 2
$5.29
POA
$4.86
$5.59

Sanitary Tee - 1-1/2
$0.52
$0.69
$0.66
$0.54

Sanitary Tee - 2
$0.71
$0.95
$0.90
$0.74

Sanitary Tee - 3
$1.70
$2.60
$2.48
$2.05

Sanitary Tee - 4
$3.67
$4.96
$4.73
$3.92

Double Sanitary Tee - 3 x 3 x 2 x 2
$3.33
$5.09
$4.86
$4.03

Double Sanitary Tee - 3
$5.59
$8.43
$8.05
$6.68

Double Sanitary Tee - 4
$8.73
$13.55
$12.95
$10.75

Double Sanitary Tee - 2
$1.99
$3.01
$2.87
$2.38

Double Sanitary Tee - 1-1/2
$1.38
$2.06
$1.97
$1.63

Double Sanitary Tee - 2 x 1-1/2
$1.41
$2.47
$2.35
$1.94

WYES

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Wye - 1-1/2
$0.79
$1.36
$1.30
$1.08

Wye - 2
$1.05
$1.37
$1.31
$1.08

Wye - 3
$1.76
$3.11
$2.96
$2.46

Wye - 4
$4.26
$5.79
$5.53
$4.58

Wye 2 x 1-1/2
$1.51
$2.41
$2.30
$1.91

Wye 3 x 2
$1.81
$2.49
$2.38
$1.97

Wye 4 x 3
$3.51
$5.41
$5.18
$4.30

Wye 4 x 2
$3.44
$4.64
$4.44
$3.68

Wye 3 x 1-1/2
$1.80
$3.19
$3.05
$2.52

Double Wye - 3
$6.32
$9.64
$9.21
$7.64

Double Wye - 4
$12.91
$19.54
$18.68
$15.50

Long Turn Tee Wye - 1-1/2
$1.55
$2.18
$1.39
$1.73

Long Turn Tee Wye - 2
$2.12
$2.83
$1.13
$2.24

Long Turn Tee Wye - 3
$3.24
$4.66
$2.95
$3.65

Long Turn Tee Wye - 4
$6.71
$9.17
$5.83
$7.26

Long Turn Tee Wye - 3 x 2
$1.90
$3.40

$2.69

ELBOWS
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Vent Elbow - 1-1/2
$0.30
$0.98
$0.94
$0.79

Vent Elbow - 2
$0.48
$1.56
$1.48
$1.23

Vent Elbow - 3
$1.24
$3.92
$3.74
$3.13

1/4 Bend w/Side Inlet - 3x3x2
$3.10
$5.25

$4.16

1/4 Bend w/Lw Heel Inlet - 3x3x2
$3.46
$14.30
$4.83
$3.99

1/4 Bend - 1-1/2
$0.31
$0.46
$0.44
$0.36

1/4 Bend - 2
$0.48
$0.72
$0.68
$0.56

1/4 Bend - 3
$1.24
$1.78
$1.70
$1.40

1/4 Bend - 4
$1.73
$3.19
$3.05
$2.52

Long Sweep 1/4 Bend - 1-1/2
$0.88
$1.45
$1.39
$1.15

Long Sweep 1/4 Bend - 2
$0.92
$1.18
$1.13
$0.94

Long Sweep 1/4 Bend - 3
$2.10
$3.09
$2.95
$2.45

Long Sweep 1/4 Bend - 4
$4.26
$6.10
$5.83
$4.84

1/8 Bend, Street - 1-1/2
$0.33
$0.49
$0.46
$0.38

1/8  Bend, Street - 2
$0.41
$0.67
$0.64
$0.53

1/8 Bend, Street - 3
$0.88
$1.65
$1.57
$1.30

1/8 Bend, Street - 4
$2.19
$3.20
$3.06
$2.61

1/4 Bend, Street - 1-1/2
$0.43
$0.69
$0.66
$0.55

1/4 Bend, Street - 2
$0.66
$0.98
$0.93
$0.77

1/4 Bend, Street - 3
$1.36
$1.95
$1.87
$1.55

1/4 Bend, Street - 4
$2.99
$5.85
$5.58
$4.63

1/8 Bend - 1-1/2
$0.36
$0.51
$0.49
$0.39

1/8 Bend - 2
$0.52
$0.75
$0.72
$0.59

1/8 Bend - 3
$1.08
$1.53
$1.46
$1.21

1/8 Bend - 4
$1.75
$2.54
$2.43
$2.02

1/16 Bend - 1-1/2
$0.53
$0.77
$0.73
$0.60

1/16 Bend - 2
$0.69
$1.03
$0.99
$0.82

1/16 Bend - 3
$1.80
$2.64
$2.53
$2.10

1/16 Bend - 4
$2.74
$4.03
$3.85
$3.19

1/6 Bend - 1-1/2
$0.61
$0.93
$0.89
$0.73

1/6 Bend -2
$0.92
$1.40
$1.33
$1.10

1/6 Bend - 3
$3.25
$4.96
$4.73
$3.92

1/6 Bend - 4
$3.91
$7.04
$6.71
$5.58

Closet Bend 4 x 3
$3.20
$5.64
$3.85
$3.19

P TRAPS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

P Trap - 1-1/2
$0.99
$1.34
$1.28
$1.06

P Trap - 2
$1.49
$1.81
$1.28
$1.44

P TRAPS, CON’T
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

P Trap w/Union - 1-1/2
$1.3666
$1.71
$1.73
$1.38

P Trap w/Union - 2
$3.78
$5.35
$2.85
$4.24

SECTION V - FINISH VALVES, SUPPLY LINES, TOILET/DRAIN REPAIR ITEMS

FINISH VALVES:  ANGLE VALVES

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

1/2 FIP x 3/8 OD
$1.56
$1.97
$6.62
$1.87

5/8 OD x 3/8 OD
$1.76
$2.35
$15.28
$1.94

1/21 SWT x 3/8 OD
$2.79
$2.05

$1.94

DUAL VALVES$

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

1/2 FIP x 3/8 OD x 1/4 OD
$4.79
$5.38

$5.47

1/2 FIP x 3/8 OD x 3/8 OD
$4.39
$5.38
$11.54
$5.47

1/2 FIP x 1/2 OD x 3/8 OD
$5.10
POA

$5.47

1/2 FIP x 1/2 OD x 1/2 OD
$5.96
POA

$5.47

5/8 OD x 3/8 OD x 3/8 OD
$4.64
$5.47

$5.47

STRAIGHT VALVES





DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

1/2 OD x 3/8 OD
$1.95
POA

$5.47

5/8 OD x 3/8 OD
$1.76
$2.61

$5.47

1/2 SWT x 3/8 OD
$2.79
$2.42

$5.47

TAP VALVES

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

1/4 Needle Valve
$2.07
POA
$3.44
$1.76

1/2 Tap Valve Assembly
$0
POA

$3.72

3/4 Tap Valve Assembly
$0
POA

$3.72

Self-Piercing Tap Valve
$1.90
POA

$2.77

Poly Tap Valve Kit
$0
POA

$6.84

Copper Tap Valve Kit
$4.94
POA

$6.84

1/4 x 1/8 Straight Tap Valve
$2.10
POA

$2.46

1/4 x 1/8 Angle Tap Valve
$2.10
POA

$2.46

TOILET REPAIR

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Chrome Flush Lever
$1.91
POA
$1.76
$1.66

TOILET REPAIR, CON’T.
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Tank Flapper Bulk
$1.67
POA
$1.12
$1.66

Toilet Tank Lever
$1.91
POA
$1.76
$1.66

Plastic Tank Float
$0.63
$0.65
$0.78
$0.46

Flush Valve
$3.00
$14.36
$43.15
$2.52

Flapper Tank Ball
$0.96
$1.00
$0.86
$1.38

Tank Repair Kit
$4.76
POA

$3.90

Anti-Siphon Tank Repair Kit
$4.76
POA

$5.36

Round Plastic Bolt Caps
$0.40
$0.53
$0.31
$0.13

Oval Plastic Bolt Caps
$0.50
$0.96
$0.31
$0.14

1/4 x 2-1/4 Closet Bolts
$0.32
$1.10
$0.47
$0.49

Toilet Tank Bowl Bolts
$1.99
$1.71
$2.36
$2.00

Closet Bowl Set
$2.76
POA
$64.58
$0.49

Bolt & Screw Set
$0.34
$1.65
$1.80
$0.49

Closet Screw Set
$0.34
POA

$0.49

Ballcock Shank Washer
$0.43
$0.25

$0.08

Univ Tank to Bowl Washer
$0.77
$0.63
$0.53
$0.86

1/4 x 3-1/2 Toilet Bolt Set
$0.40
POA
$0.47
$0.55

Fluid Level Control Valve
$4.76
POA

$3.97

Toilet Tank Repair Kit
$4.76
POA

$5.36

Flusher Fixer Kit
$3.58
POA

$3.58

Replacement Seal
$0.73
POA

$0.47

Wax Ring with Sleeve
$0.46
$1.00
$0.45
$0.49

Wax Ring without Sleeve
$0.35
$0.70
$0.36
$0.34

SUPPLY LINES

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

3/8 OD x 1/2 FIP x 16
$2.89
$2.56

$2.16

3/8 OD x 1/2 FIP x 20
$3.14
$2.82

$2.16

3/8 OD x 1/2 IP x 12
$2.18
$2.31

$2.14

3/8 OD x 1/2 IP x 16
$2.89
$2.56

$2.16

3/8 OD x 1/2 IP x 20
$3.14
$2.82

$2.16

3/8 OD x 1/2 IP x 36
$5.49
$3.74

$2.52

3/8 x 7/8 BC x 12
$2.18
$2.31

$2.54

3/8 x 7/8 BC x 20
$3.14
$2.82

$2.76

3/8 OD x 1/2 IP x 36
$5.49
$3.74

$2.76

3/8 x 7/8 BC x 12
$2.18
$2.31

$2.54

3/8 x 7/8 BC x 20
$3.14
$2.82

$2.76

1/2 x 7/8 BC x 20
$3.14
$3.07

$2.76

1/2 x 1/2 IP x 16
$3.29
$2.76

$2.16

SUPPLY LINES, CON’T
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

1/2 X 1/2 IP x 20
$3.42
$3.07

$2.16

1/2 x 7/8 x 12
$2.62
$2.51

$2.16

3/8 OD x 3/8 C x 16
$2.99
$2.56

$2.16

CHROME FINISH

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

3/8 OD x 12 Faucet Supply
$1.12
POA
$2.52
$1.82

3/8 OD x 20 Faucet Supply
$1.95
POA
$3.17
$1.92

3/8 OD x 12 Toilet Supply
$1.12
$2.34

$1.82

3/8 OD x 20 Toilet Supply
$1.95
$3.02

$1.92

STAINLESS STEEL

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

3/8 OD x 1/2 FIP x 16
$2.22
$4.84

$2.17

3/8 OD X 1/2 FIP x 20
$3.14
$5.50

$2.46

3/8 OD x 7/8 BC x 12
$2.18
$4.22

$1.98

3/8 OD x 7/8 BC x 20
$3.14
$5.50

$2.86

3/8 OD x 3/8 C x 12
$2.42
$4.22

$2.17

DRAIN REPAIR

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

SS Basket Strainer
$5.19
$1.49
$3.50
$5.88%

ABS Sink Basket Strainer
$3.99
POA

$2.15

Sink Spray Head
$2.87
POA
$2.35
$5.40

1-5/8 Drain Strainer
$0.30
POA

$2.62

Replacement Sink Strainer
$1.58
POA
$20.66
$1.52

1-1/8 To 1-1/4 Basin Stopper
$0.76
POA
$0.71
$0.49

1-3/8 To 1-1/2 Basin Stopper
$0.76
POA

$0.49

1-1/2 To 2 Rubber Tub Stopper
$0.84
$1.06

$0.49

Rubber Garbage Disposer Stopper
$2.07
$0.98

$2.10

Flat Rubber Sink Stopper
$1.29
POA

$2.40

1-2/4 Faucet Hole Cover
$0.71
POA
$0.52
$0.90

1-1/4 x 5 Chrome Lav Strainer
$7.95
$4.93

$6.42

3-1/2 SS Sink Basket Strainer
$5.19
$1.49

$5.88

3-1/2 ABS Sink Basket Strainer
$3.99
POA

$2.15

SECTION VI - FLEX CONNECTORS & MISCELLANEOUS PLASTIC FITTINGS
DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Qwik Cap - 1-1/2
$0.95
$1.54
$1.41
$1.26

Qwik Cap - 2
$1.05
$1.65
$1.54
$1.36

FLEX CONNECTORS & MISCELLANEOUS PLASTIC FITTINGS, CON’T.
Robertson
Marico 
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Qwik Cap - 3
$1.15
$2.43
$2.06
$1.85

Qwik - 4
$1.28
$2.61
$2.32
$2.12

DONUTS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

DWV Pipe HUB x HUB - 2 CI x 1-1/2
$1.91
POA

$2.52

DWV Pipe HUB x HUB - 3 CI x 3
$2.20
POA

$2.67

DWV Pipe HUB x HUB - 4 CI x 3
$2.44
POA

$3.36

DWV Pipe HUB x HUB - 4 CI x 4
$2.41
POA

$3.36

DRAIN CONNECTORS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Shower Conn. - 2 DWV
$3.90
POA

$0.77

DRAINS


DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

PRICE EACH

Snap-In ABS - 2
$1.32
POA

$2.96

Snap-In PVC - 2
$1.26
$1.29

$2.82

Snap-In ABS - 3
$2.00
POA

$2.96

Snap-In PVC - 3
$1.90
$2.44

$2.82

Snap-In ABS - 4
$2.30
POA

$2.98

Snap-In PVC - 4
$2.22
$2.82

$3.14

Shower Stall ABS - 2
$7.30
$6.36

$4.27

Shower Stall PVC 2
$6.94
$4.27

$3.94

Gen. Purpose ABS 2 x 3
$3.56
$3.96

$2.83

Gen. Purpose PVC 2 x 3
$3.39
$3.43

$2.70

Gen. Purpose ABS 3 x 4
$14.18
POA

$5.01

Gen. Purpose PVC 3 x 4
$13.53
$6.15

$4.77

Low Profile ABS 2 x 3
$7.62
POA

$9.00

Low Profile PVC 2 x 3
$7.25
POA

$9.00

No-Caulk Shower PVC 2
$6.95
$5.10

$4.36

SADDLE TEES

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

ABS 3 x 2 or 1-1/2
$4.55
POA

$5.28

PVC 3 X 2 or 1-1/2
$4.34
POA

$5.28

ABS 4 x 2 or 1-1/2
$4.85
POA

$5.28

PVC 4 x 2 or 1-1/2
$4.61
$3.81

$5.28

SADDLE TEES, CON’T.
Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

ABS 4 x 4 or 3
$6.03
POA

$5.28

FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

DWV x DWV 1-1/4 x 1-1/4
$1.20
$2.71

$1.37

DWV x DWV 1-1/2 x 1-1/4
$1.28
POA
$1.72
$1.51

DWV x DWV 1-1/2 x 1-1/2
$1.37
$3.25
$1.66
$1.46

DWV x DWV 2 x 1-1/2
$1.91
$3.64
$1.89
$1.67

DWV x DWV 2 x 2
$1.41
$3.37
$1.79
$1.57

DWV x DWV 3 x 2
$1.66
$4.27
$2.20
$1.94

DWV x DWV 3 x 3
$2.20
$4.36
$2.41
$2.12

DWV x DWV 4 x 3
$2.44
$6.09
$3.25
$2.86

DWV x DWV 4 x 4
$2.41
$5.07
$3.02
$2.46

DWV x DWV 4 Clay x 4 C.I.
$2.49
$4.78
$3.02
$2.82

COUPLINGS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

No-Hub 1-1/2
$1.39
$2.26
$1.39
$1.46

No-Hub 2
$1.44
$2.61
$1.39
$1.46

No-Hub 3
$1.69
$2.97
$1.65
$1.74

No-Hub 4
$1.91
$3.49
$1.97
$2.07

FLEXIBLE TUBULAR COUPLINGS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACJ
PRICE EACH

Drain Trap 1-1/2 or 1-1/4
$0.99
POA
$0.66
$1.51

Trap Connector 1-1/2 or 1-1/4
$1.31
POA
$1.19
$1.54

Tube Connector 1-1/2 or 1-1/4
$1.17
POA

$1.54

FLEXIBLE DWV PIPE FITTINGS

DESCRIPTION
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH
PRICE EACH

Qwik Elbow 1-1/2
$_____________________
POA
$1.93
$4.70

Qwik Elbow 2
$_____________________
POA
$2.05
$5.00

Qwik Elbow 3
$_____________________
POA
$3.04
$7.42

Qwik Tee 1-1/2
$_____________________
POA
$2.41
$5.88

Qwik Tee 2
$_____________________
POA
$2.61
$6.37

Qwik Tee 3
$_____________________
POA
$3.99
$9.73

SECTION VII - PLUMBING FIXTURES AND REPAIR PARTS


Robertson
Marico
Ferguson
Empire


MANUFACTURES SUGGESTED PRICE LIST NUMBER & EFFECTIVE DATES
% DISC. FROM M.S.P.
MANUFACTURES SUGGESTED PRICE LIST NUMBER & EFFECTIVE DATES
% DISC. FROM M.S.P.
MANUFACTURES SUGGESTED PRICE LIST NUMBER & EFFECTIVE DATES
% DISC. FROM M.S.P.
MANUFACTURES SUGGESTED PRICE LIST NUMBER & EFFECTIVE DATES
% DISC. FROM M.S.P.

Sloan
WLP96
40%

POA
WLP-96/042297
20%
CLP-96 1-1-96
X.60 OR 40%

Eljer
_________________
25%


N/A
NO
CP-90  4-6-98
X.675 OR 32.5%

Elkay
WD131
40%


SB-49
25%
SINKS S898 4-20-99

DF DF38 1-24-00
X.75 OR 25%

X.75 OR 25%

American Standard
_________________
25%


N/A
NO
NO QUOTE
NO QUOTE

Kohler
FEB 1, 2000
25%


FEB 1, 1999
35%
2-1-00
x.70 OR 30%

Delta
JAN 3, 2000
40%


JAN 4, 1999
35%
FULL LINE 1-3-00
X.675 OR 32.5%
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