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Tires and Tubes

Opening Date:  June 29, 2000
PASSENGER TIRES
HIGHWAY TREAD, BLACK WALL, TUBELESS
(Original Equipment or Acceptable Equal)

SECTION 1:

           T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
TIRE SIZE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE

P175/80R13
402136477
Goodyear
$23.02
20003
Starfire Flite Line IV
$27.32
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P185/80R13
402024477
Goodyear
$23.82
20004
Starfire Flite Line IV
$28.88
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P185/75R14
402853436
Goodyear
$25.75
20006
Starfire Flite Line IV
$29.88
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P185/70R14
402102477
Goodyear
$23.33
35526
Starfire Flite Line IV
$30.84
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P195/75R14
402645436
Goodyear
$24.91
20007
Starfire Flite Line IV
$30.71
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P195/70R14
402827047
Goodyear
$25.53
35510
Starfire Flite Line IV
$26.67
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P205/55R15
116063599
Goodyear
$32.41
090908
Remington
$62.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P205/50Z15
164017042
Goodyear
$86.59
090324
Remington
$84.95
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

SECTION 1(con’t)
           T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
P215/70R14
402359436
Goodyear
$29.52
35504
Starfire Flite Line IV
$38.56
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P215/75R14
402434436
Goodyear
$28.53
20009
Starfire Flite Line IV
$34.67
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P205/75R15
402705436
Goodyear
$23.85
20012
Starfire Flite Line IV
$33.80
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P215/65R15
768410827
Goodyear
$32.83
38923
Starfire Sprectrum LXR
$43.88
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P215/75R15
402391436
Goodyear
$30.55
20013
Starfire Flite Line IV
$35.02
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P225/70R15
402392436
Goodyear
$32.72
35512
Starfire Flite Line IV
$41.90
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P225/75R15
402692436
Goodyear
$31.63
20014
Starfire Flite Line IV
$37.12
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P235/75R15
750403551
Goodyear
$33.87
20015
Starfire Flite Line IV
$37.92
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

POLICE & HIGHWAY PATROL TIRES
HIGHWAY TREAD, BLACK WALL

SECTION 2:

Tires must be certified for 50 miles at 115/130 mile per hour.  Note:  Bidder must submit proof of certification with bid.


           T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
TIRE SIZE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE

P215/70HR14
104822486
Goodyear
$36.40
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P225/70HR15
104876486
Goodyear
$39.87
067938
Firehawk PV431
$45.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

PASSENGER TIRES
MUD & SNOW, BLACKWALL, TUBELESS
(Original Equipment or Equal)

SECTION 3: 
         

  T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
TIRE SIZE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE

P165/80R13
115131624
Goodyear
$21.22
32502
Starfire Wintermaster +
$38.90
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P205/75R15
766705405
Goodyear
$28.79
32509
Starfire Wintermaster +
$48.87
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

P235/75R15
766710405
Goodyear
$36.06
32513
Starfire Wintermaster +
$59.56
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

TRUCK TIRES
HIGHWAY TREAD, BLACKWALL, BIAS PLY, TUBELESS
(Original Equipment or Equal)

SECTION 4:


T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
TIRE SIZE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE

7.00-15,6 Ply
312044090
Goodyear
$39.00
3925054CK
KENDA
$40.00
37315
Kelly
$52.19

7.50-16,8 Ply
312099090
Goodyear
$52.25
69LT7508
KENDA
$48.00
37332
Kelly
$64.53

8.00-16.5,6Ply
312128090
Goodyear
$46.66
76402
STARFIRE BRONCO RIB
$69.44
37309
Kelly
$593.25

9.50-16.5,8Ply
312217090
Goodyear
$53.41
76404
STARFIRE BRONCO RIB
$85.33
37333
Kelly
$74.00

TRUCK TIRES
HIGHWAY TREAD, BLACKWALL, TUBE TYPE
(Original Equipment or Equal)

SECTION 5:


T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
TIRE SIZE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE

7.500-20,10 Ply

PowerKing
$98.09
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

8.25-20,10 Ply

DAN
$84.88

SUPERFLEET 5 RIB
$74.52
7630010
Denman
$97.80

9.00-20,10 Ply

DAN
$92.69

SUPERFLEET 5 RIB
$87.43
7630013
Denman
$107.90

10.00-20,12 Ply

DAN
$109.85

SUPERFLEET 5 RIB
$104.16
7630022
Denman
$119.00

11.00-20,12 Ply

DAN
$165.88
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

TRUCK TIRES
HIGHWAY TREAD, BLACKWALL, RADIAL, TUBE TYPE
(Original Equipment or Acceptable Equal)

SECTION 6:


T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
TIRE SIZE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE

750 R16,8 Ply
744238847
Goodyear
$53.30
76401
STARFIRE BRONCO RIB
$80.00
10818
Michelin
$115.93

1100 R20,16Ply
138382848
Goodyear
$225.90
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
24901
Michelin
$264.83

1200 R20,16Ply
138389427
Goodyear
$207.19
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
29009
Michelin
$307.05

TRUCK TIRES
MUD & SNOW READ, BLACKWALL, TUBE TYPE, BIAS
(Original Equipment or Acceptable Equal)

SECTION 7:


T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
TIRE SIZE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE

7.50 -16,8 Ply
313099091
Goodyear
$54.22
69LT75OM
KENDA
$50.00
7620416
Denman
$64.00

8.25-20,10 Ply

DAN
$89.08

DYNASTAR
$77.01
7620418
Denman
$112.00

9.00-20,10 Ply

DAN
$96.29

DYNASTAR
$88.17
7630023
Denman
$120.00

10.00-20,12 Ply

DAN
$116.81

DYNASTAR
$110.04
763064
Denman
$147.00

11.00-20,16 Ply

DAN
$174.88
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

GRADER/LOADER TIRES
TUBELESS TYPE

SECTION 8:


T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters
TIRE SIZE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE
BIDDER’S TIRE NUMBER
BIDDER’S TIRE NAME
UNIT NET PRICE

13.00-24,12Ply
123398648
Goodyear
$250.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
7647114
Denman
$226.00

17.5-24,12Ply
165756314
Goodyear
$212.20
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
7641622
Denman
$254.00

17.5-25,12Ply
123897458
Goodyear
$365.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
7641224
Denman
$316.00

17.5-25,16Ply
123876458
Goodyear
$430.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
7641228
Denman
$380.00

SECTION 9 NOT INCLUDED IN BID REQUEST

SECTION 10:





TUBES

The TUBES listed below will be available at the discount indicated from the “Net State and Federal Open Market” Price List:



T & W Tire



Commercial Distributing, Inc.


        Mileage Masters                                                   Each

A. Automobile Tubes
40% Discount


64.9%*




       Net price as provided 

B. Truck Tubes
40% Discount


64.8%





       Net price as provided

C. Industrial Tubes
40% Discount


64.7%





       Net price as provided

D. Farm Tubes
40% Discount


64.7%





       Net price as provided

*See product list and cost sheet

If you have questions or comments concerning this bid compilation, please contact Patricia Cummings by phone at 918-596-7561 or by E-Mail at pcummings@ci.tulsa.ok.us.
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