	City of Tulsa Purchasing Division - Bid Summary       

Bid: TAC101E
Description: Powdered Activated Carbon    
Commodity Code: 885-08
Date of Opening: December 1, 2011


	Standard Carbon, LLC
	Norit Americas, Inc
	SNR Technologies, LLC
	Jacobi Carbons, Inc 

	Item
	Description
	Estimated Annual

QTY
	Unit of Measure
	Unit Cost
	Extended Cost
	Unit Cost
	Extended Cost
	Unit Cost
	Extended Cost
	Unit Cost
	Extended Cost

	1
	Product#1: Lignite
	63
	Tons
	1,121.00
	70,623.00
	1,440.00
	90,720.00
	1,240.00
	78,120.00
	1360.00
	85,680.00

	2
	Product #2: Bituminous
	40
	Tons
	1,518.00
	60,720.00
	1,440.00
	57,600.00
	1,340.00
	53,600.00
	NA
	NA

	3
	Extended time for additional 4-person team for 1 hour.
	4
	Hours
	80.00
	320.00
	250.00
	1,000.00
	NA
	NA
	NA
	NA

	TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:

 (All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified )
	$131,663.00
	$149,320.00
	$131,720.00
	$85,680.00


	MWV Specialty Chemicals
	F2 Industries, LLC

	Item
	Description
	Estimated Annual

QTY
	Unit of Measure
	Unit Cost
	Extended Cost
	Unit Cost
	Extended Cost

	1
	Product#1: Lignite
	63
	Tons
	1140
	71,820.
	No bid
	No bid

	2
	Product #2: Bituminous
	40
	Tons
	NA
	NA
	1,400.00
	56,000.00

	3
	Extended time for additional 4-person team for 1 hour.
	4
	Hours
	NA
	NA
	No bid
	No bid

	TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:

 (All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified )
	$71,820.00
	$56,000.00


No Bid: Kemira Water Solutions,, Inc 

Prepared by: Sonya Glenn
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