CITY OF TULSA PURCHASING DIVISION-BID SUMMARY

BID TAC181B

DESCRIPTION: FIRE EXTINGUISHER SERVICE

DATE OF OPENING: 03-20-03


AUTOMATIC PROTECTION SYSTEMS CORP.

SECTION I: INSPECTIONS
(4 points awarded to lowest bidder per item; 2 points awarded to second lowest bidder per item.Total of 32 points possible.)



Pressurized Units:


      Each Cost

	0-30 lbs.
	$ 5.00

	50-125 lbs.
	$ 24.00

	Loaded Stream (annual tear down)
	$ 6.00

	CO2 Continuity Test
	$1.25





Cartridge Units:  


     Each Cost

	0-30 lbs.
	$ 12.00

	50 lbs.
	$35.00

	150 lbs.
	$74.00

	350 lbs.
	$105.00


KITCHEN RANGE HOOD SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

(To be Performed Per NFPA 17 or 17A as applicable)

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per system, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per system.  Total of 4 points possible)

	Wet Chemical Systems
	Dry Chemical Systems

	Semi Annual Inspection

per System:                                 $55.00
	Semi-Annual Inspection

per System:                            $55.00


	Fusible Link Replacement         $   4.50                    ea. 
	Fusible Link Replacement    $  4.50                           ea.


SPRINKLER SYSTEMS
(To be Performed Per NFPA 25)

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per riser, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per riser.  Total of 6 points possible)

Contractor License No: ___332_______________________________________      No Bid:______________

	Quarterly Inspection of Sprinkler System:                               $         65.00                                      per riser

	Semi-Annual Inspection of Sprinkler System:                         $       75.00                                         per riser

	Annual Inspection of Sprinkler System:                                   $       95.00                                         per riser


STANDPIPE SYSTEMS
(To Be Performed Per NFPA 25)

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per standpipe, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per standpipe.  Total of 4 points possible)

Contractor License No:_332_______________________________________      No Bid:______________  

	Quarterly Inspection of Standpipe System:                               $   55.00                                      per standpipe

	Annual Inspection of Sprinkler System:                                     $   65.00                                      per standpipe


(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per item; 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per item.  Total of 256 points possible)

PRESSURIZED DRY CHEMICAL
(Indicate Each Pricing below)
	Size
	ABC/PK

Recharge
	ABC/PK

6 yr. Maint.
	ABC/PK

Hydrotest
	BC

Recharge
	BC

6 yr.  Maint.
	BC

Hydrotest

	2 ½ lb.
	$9.50
	$6.00
	$9.50
	$8.00
	
$
$5.00
	$8.50

	5 lb.
	$14.25
	$6.00
	$12.00
	$10.00
	$5.00
	$10.50

	10 lb.
	$19.75
	$6.00
	$14.00
	$15.00
	$5.00
	$12.50

	20 lb.
	$29.00
	$6.00
	$15.00
	$20.00
	$5.00
	$13.50

	50 lb.
	$70.00
	$6.00
	$15.00
	$60.00
	$5.00
	$14.50

	125-150 lbs.
	$200.00
	$6.00
	$75.00
	$150.00
	$5.00
	$75.00


CARTRIDGE OPERATED UNITS

(Indicate Each Pricing Below - Include Hydrotesting  of Hose Where Applicable & Cartridge Exchange)

	Size
	ABC/PK

Recharge
	ABC/PK

Hydrotest
	BC

Recharge
	BC

Hydrotest

	2 ½ lb.
	$19.00
	$12.00
	$18.06
	$10.00

	5 lb.
	$20.00
	$14.00
	$19.00
	$12.00

	10 lb.
	$28.00
	$14.00
	$21.00
	$12.00

	20 lb.
	$35.00
	$14.00
	$33.00
	$12.00

	50 lb.
	$70.00
	$18.00
	$65.00
	$16.00

	125 lb.
	$200.00
	$110.00
	$175.00
	$100.00


(Indicate Each Pricing Below- Include Hydrotesting of Hose)

	150 lb.
	$220.00
	$165.00
	$185.00
	$145.00

	350 lb.
	$335.00
	$225.00
	$275.00
	$200.00


CARBON DIOXIDE UNITS

(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

	CO2 PORTABLE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS
	CO2 WHEELED FIRE EXTINGUISHERS

	Size
	Recharge
	Hydrotest
	Size
	Recharge
	Hydrotest

	2 ½ - 5 lb.
	$8.00
	$10.00
	50 lb.
	$38.00
	$21.00

	10 lb.
	$14.00
	$12.50
	75 lb.
	$42.00
	$21.00

	15 lb.
	$15.00
	$12.50
	100 lb.
	$61.00
	$21.00

	20 lb.
	$16.00
	$12.50
	
	
	


LIQUID UNITS

(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

	Type
	Recharge
	Hydrotest

	2 ½ Gallon Water Pressure
	$6.50
	$10.00

	2 ½ Gallon Loaded Stream
	$45.00
	$10.00

	2 ½ Gallon Pump Tank (thru 5 gal)
	$6.50
	NA

	2 ½ Gallon AFFF
	$9.50
	$10.00

	2 ½ Gallon FFFP
	$17.50
	$10.00

	K-Class
	$48.00
	$10.00


CLEAN AGENT FIRE EXTINGUISHERS
(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

	Type / Size
	Recharge
	Six-year Maintenance
	Hydrotest

	Halon  2 ½ lb
	$35.00
	$35.00
	$40.00

	Halon 5 lb
	$75.00
	$35.00
	$40.00

	Halon 10 lb/9 lb
	$145.00
	$35.00
	$40.00

	Halon 17 lb
	$204.00
	$35.00
	$40.00

	Halon Wheeled  (150 lb)
	$1800.00
	$100.00
	$140.00

	FE-36 5 lb
	$80.00
	$35.00
	$40.00

	FE-36 10 lb
	$135.00
	$35.00
	$40.00

	FE-36 14 lb./20 lb
	$185.00
	$35.00
	$40.00


FIRE HOSE

(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

	Size
	Hydrotest 

	1 ½”    (50’ - 100’ section)
	$25.00

	2 ½”    (25’ - 50’ section)
	$25.00


KITCHEN HOOD SUPRESSION SYSTEMS
(Indicate Each Price Below)

	SYSTEM SIZE
	RECHARGE ONLY
	RECHARGE & HYDRO

	1.5 GALLONS
	$265.00
	$320.00

	3.0 GALLONS
	$300.00
	                $355.00

	4.5 GALLONS
	$335.00
	$390.00

	6.0 GALLONS
	$375.00
	$425.00


 (This service work includes all parts and labor)

SECTION III: OTHER SERVICES / SUPPLIES:

(Indicate Each Price Below)

(5 points awarded to lowest bidder per item; 2 point awarded to second lowest bidder per item.  Total of 20 points possible)

	DOT/OSHA Label for Fire Extinguisher

    (Green Diamond w/ required Marking Info.)
	$NO CHARGE

	HMIS (Hazardous Material Information System) Label for Fire Extinguisher / System Cylinders
	$NO CHARGE

	Bar Code Initial Set up (Label & Data Entry):

Price per unit/system/extinguisher/etc.
	$1.00

	Bar Code Label Replacement:
	$1.00


SELF-CONTAINED BREATHING APPARATUS AIR BOTTLES (SCBA’S)

(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per item, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per item.  Total of 12 points possible)

	SCBA Tumbling
	$11.50

	SCBA  Hydrotest
	$10.00 LOW PRESSURE OR $40.00 HIGH PRESSURE

	SCBA Refill Only  2215 psi units
	$8.00

	SCBA Refill Only  4500 psi units
	$10.00

	SCBA Annual Inspection (Posi-check)
	$61.00

	SCBA Valve Reconditioning
	$14.50


SECTION IV: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER PRICING

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per extinguisher, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per extinguisher.  Points awarded on quantities of 1-3 only.  Total of 38 points possible)

	Manufacture
	Part No.
	Size
	UL Rating
	Qty 1-3
	Qty 4-9
	Qty 10+

	ABC

	ANSUL
	429320
	2 ½ LB
	1A-10BC
	$28.00
	$26.00
	$24.00

	ANSUL
	429103
	5 LB
	3A-40BC
	$35.00
	$34.00
	$33.00

	ANSUL
	429003
	10 LB
	10A-60BC
	$59.00
	$57.00
	$55.00

	ANSUL
	429006
	20 LB
	20A-120BC
	$98.00
	$96.00
	$94.00

	BC

	ANSUL
	429105
	2 ½ LB
	10BC
	$23.00
	$22.00
	$21.00

	ANSUL
	429014
	5 LB
	40BC
	$34.00
	$33.00
	$31.00

	ANSUL
	429015
	10 LB
	40BC
	$61.00
	$59.00
	$56.00

	ANSUL
	429017
	20 LB
	80BC
	$95.00
	$93.00
	$90.00

	CO2

	ANSUL
	429320
	5 LB
	5BC
	$108.00
	$103.00
	$95.00

	ANSUL
	429321
	10 LB
	10BC
	$155.00
	$150.00
	$145.00

	ANSUL
	429322
	15 LB
	10BC
	$179.00
	$175.00
	$170.00

	ANSUL
	429323
	20 LB
	10BC
	$205.00
	$200.00
	$195.00

	Purple K

	ANSUL
	429008
	5 LB
	60BC
	$42.00
	$40.00
	$38.00

	ANSUL
	429009
	10 LB
	80BC
	$62.00
	$60.00
	$58.00

	ANSUL
	429011
	20 LB
	120BC
	$95.00
	$90.00
	$85.00

	Water Pressure

	ANSUL
	P54
	2 ½  Gallon
	2A
	$68.00
	$67.00
	$66.00

	Clean Agent FE-36

	ANSUL
	429020
	6 LB
	5BC
	$154.00
	$150.00
	$145.00

	ANSUL
	429021
	10 LB
	1A10BC
	$290.00
	$285.00
	$275.00

	ANSUL
	429022
	14 LB
	2A20BC
	$485.00
	$475.00
	$465.00

	 K-Class  (PRICES AND SIZES TO BE SUPPLIED BY BIDDER)

	ANSUL
	430849
	6LITER
	2A CK
	$135.00
	$133.00
	$131.00

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	PULL PINS, ETC
	
	
	
	
	
	

	PO98
	PULL PIN
	$1.00
	P101
	LOCKING CAMS
	$4.00
	

	P100
	CHAINS
	$1.00
	P102
	TAMPER SEAL
	$.75
	

	P103
	OUTDOOR PRESSURE SENSITIVE INSPECTION LABEL
	$3.00
	VALVE STEMS
	$4.75
	WALL HANGERS
	$2.00

	O-RINGS

	P104
	STANDARD DRY CHEMICAL
	$2.50
	P105
	GENERAL &SF
	$6.50


ANSUL CARTRIDGES

4.5 lbs
  $23.00

10 lbs


$24.20

20 lbs


$29.20

30 lbs

$32.00

General cartridges

4.5 lbs



10lbs

#G23990
$63.00

20 lbs

#G23991
$66.00

30 lbs

#G23992
$69.00

Note:  All new fire extinguishers purchased MUST include cost of first year’s annual inspection tag and required labeling.

Total points possible

372

Terms net 30

DELIVERY 7 DAYS

SIMPLEXGRINNELL LP




Pressurized Units:


      Each Cost

	0-30 lbs.
	$5.50

	50-125 lbs.
	$ 65.00

	Loaded Stream (annual tear down)
	$ 5.50

	CO2 Continuity Test
	$ 1.50





Cartridge Units:  


     Each Cost

	0-30 lbs.
	$ 10.85

	50 lbs.
	$ 65.00

	150 lbs.
	$ 80.00

	350 lbs.
	$ 125.00


KITCHEN RANGE HOOD SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

(To be Performed Per NFPA 17 or 17A as applicable)

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per system, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per system.  Total of 4 points possible)

	Wet Chemical Systems
	Dry Chemical Systems

	Semi Annual Inspection

per System:                                 $ 65.00
	Semi-Annual Inspection

per System:                            $ 65.00

	Fusible Link Replacement         $   12.00                 ea. 
	Fusible Link Replacement    $            12.00            ea.


SPRINKLER SYSTEMS
(To be Performed Per NFPA 25)

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per riser, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per riser.  Total of 6 points possible)

Contractor License No: _____0731_____________________________________      No Bid:______________

	Quarterly Inspection of Sprinkler System:                               $       112.50                                      per riser

	Semi-Annual Inspection of Sprinkler System:                         $       112.50                                      per riser

	Annual Inspection of Sprinkler System:                                   $       150.00                                       per riser


STANDPIPE SYSTEMS
(To Be Performed Per NFPA 25)

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per standpipe, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per standpipe.  Total of 4 points possible)

Contractor License No:_______0731___________________________________      No Bid:______________  

	Quarterly Inspection of Standpipe System:                               $        112.50                               per standpipe

	Annual Inspection of Sprinkler System:                                     $         112.50                              per standpipe


(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per item; 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per item.  Total of 256 points possible)

PRESSURIZED DRY CHEMICAL
(Indicate Each Pricing below)
	Size
	ABC/PK

Recharge
	ABC/PK

6 yr. Maint.
	ABC/PK

Hydrotest
	BC

Recharge
	BC

6 yr.  Maint.
	BC

Hydrotest

	2 ½ lb.
	$12.75
	$9.75
	$12.00
	$12.75
	$
	$12.00

	5 lb.
	$13.75
	$12.75
	$12.00
	$13.50
	$12.75
	$12.00

	10 lb.
	$14.00
	$13.00
	$12.00
	$14.00
	$13.00
	$12.00

	20 lb.
	$15.00
	$14.00
	$12.00
	$15.00
	$14.00
	$12.00

	50 lb.
	$45.00
	$45.00
	$32.00
	$45.00
	$45.00
	$32.00

	125-150 lbs.
	$125.00
	$125.00
	$120.00
	$125.00
	$125.00
	$120.00

	
	
	
	
	
	
	


CARTRIDGE OPERATED UNITS

(Indicate Each Pricing Below - Include Hydrotesting  of Hose Where Applicable & Cartridge Exchange)

	Size
	ABC/PK

Recharge
	ABC/PK

Hydrotest
	BC

Recharge
	BC

Hydrotest

	2 ½ lb.
	$20.00
	$15.00
	$20.00
	$15.00

	5 lb.
	$20.00
	$15.00
	$20.00
	$15.00

	10 lb.
	$30.00
	$15.00
	$30.00
	$15.00

	20 lb.
	$30.00
	$15.00
	$30.00
	$15.00

	50 lb.
	$85.00
	$15.00
	$85.00
	$15.00

	125 lb.
	$125.00
	$70.00
	$125.00
	$70.00

	
	
	
	
	


(Indicate Each Pricing Below- Include Hydrotesting of Hose)

	150 lb.
	$125.00
	$125.00
	$125.00
	$125.00

	350 lb.
	$175.00
	$175.00
	4175.00
	$175.00


CARBON DIOXIDE UNITS

(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

	CO2 PORTABLE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS
	CO2 WHEELED FIRE EXTINGUISHERS

	Size
	Recharge
	Hydrotest
	Size
	Recharge
	Hydrotest

	2 ½ - 5 lb.
	$12.75
	$23.00
	50 lb.
	$75.00
	$45.00

	10 lb.
	$12.75
	$24.00
	75 lb.
	$98.00
	$65.00

	15 lb.
	$14.00
	$31.00
	100 lb.
	$98.00
	$65.00

	20 lb.
	$18.00
	$35.00
	
	
	


LIQUID UNITS

(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

	Type
	Recharge
	Hydrotest

	2 ½ Gallon Water Pressure
	$9.00
	$9.00

	2 ½ Gallon Loaded Stream
	$9.00
	$9.00

	2 ½ Gallon Pump Tank (thru 5 gal)
	$9.00
	$9.00

	2 ½ Gallon AFFF
	$27.00
	$12.00

	2 ½ Gallon FFFP
	$27.00
	$12.00

	K-Class
	$32.00
	$12.00


CLEAN AGENT FIRE EXTINGUISHERS
(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

	Type / Size
	Recharge
	Six-year Maintenance
	Hydrotest

	Halon  2 ½ lb
	$115.00
	$18.00
	$26.00

	Halon 5 lb
	$160.00
	$18.00
	$26.00

	Halon 10 lb
	$325.00
	$20.00
	$26.00

	Halon 17 lb
	$365.00
	$20.00
	$26.00

	Halon Wheeled  (150 lb)
	$675.00
	$75.00
	$125.00

	FE-36 5 lb
	$320.00
	$45.00
	$45.00

	FE-36 10 lb
	$330.00
	$45.00
	$45.00

	FE-36 14 lb.
	$365.00
	$45.00
	$45.00


FIRE HOSE

(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

	Size
	Hydrotest 

	1 ½”    (50’ - 100’ section)
	$20.00

	2 ½”    (25’ - 50’ section)
	$35.00


KITCHEN HOOD SUPRESSION SYSTEMS
(Indicate Each Price Below)

	SYSTEM SIZE
	RECHARGE ONLY
	RECHARGE & HYDRO

	1.5 GALLONS
	$225.00
	$190.00

	3.0 GALLONS
	$255.00
	$235.00

	4.5 GALLONS
	$375.00
	$325.00

	6.0 GALLONS
	$425.00
	$400.00


 (This service work includes all parts and labor)

SECTION III: OTHER SERVICES / SUPPLIES:

(Indicate Each Price Below)

(5 points awarded to lowest bidder per item; 2 point awarded to second lowest bidder per item.  Total of 20 points possible)

	DOT/OSHA Label for Fire Extinguisher

    (Green Diamond w/ required Marking Info.)
	$ NO CHARGE

	HMIS (Hazardous Material Information System) Label for Fire Extinguisher / System Cylinders
	$ NO CHARGE

	Bar Code Initial Set up (Label & Data Entry):

Price per unit/system/extinguisher/etc.
	$ FOR NFPA REQUIRED INSPECTION FORM IN PLACE OF BAR CODE

	Bar Code Label Replacement:
	$ NO LABEL REQUIRED


SELF-CONTAINED BREATHING APPARATUS AIR BOTTLES (SCBA’S)

(Indicate Each Pricing Below)

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per item, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per item.  Total of 12 points possible)

	SCBA Tumbling
	$ 25.00

	SCBA  Hydrotest
	$ 12.00

	SCBA Refill Only  2215 psi units
	$ 8.50

	SCBA Refill Only  4500 psi units
	$ 20.00

	SCBA Annual Inspection (Posi-check)
	$ 5.50

	SCBA Valve Reconditioning
	$ 375.00


SECTION IV: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER PRICING

(2 points awarded to lowest bidder per extinguisher, 1 point awarded to second lowest bidder per extinguisher.  Points awarded on quantities of 1-3 only.  Total of 38 points possible)

	Manufacture
	Part No.
	Size
	UL Rating
	Qty 1-3
	Qty 4-9
	Qty 10+

	ABC

	ANSUL
	AA02VB
	2 ½ LB
	1-A 10B C
	$30.00
	$30.00
	$30.00

	ANSUL
	AA05VB
	5 LB
	3-A 40 B C
	$40.00
	$40.00
	$40.00

	ANSUL
	A10H
	10 LB
	10 A 60 B C
	$55.00
	$55.00
	$55.00

	ANSUL
	AA20
	20 LB
	10 A 120 B C
	$90.00
	$90.00
	$90.00

	BC

	ANSUL
	CO2VB
	2 ½ LB
	10 BC
	$30.00
	$30.00
	$30.00

	ANSUL
	CO5
	5 LB
	40 B C
	$40.00
	$40.00
	$40.00

	ANSUL
	C10
	10 LB
	40 B C
	$55.00
	$55.00
	$55.00

	ANSUL
	C20
	20 LB
	80 B C
	$90.00
	$90.00
	$90.00

	CO2

	ANSUL
	CD05A
	5 LB
	5 BC
	$125.00
	$125.00
	$125.00

	ANSUL
	CD10A
	10 LB
	10 BC
	$142.00
	$142.00
	$142.00

	ANSUL
	CD 15A
	15 LB
	10 BC
	$195.00
	$195.00
	$195.00

	ANSUL
	CD20A
	20 LB
	$275.00
	$275.00
	$275.00
	$275.00

	Purple K

	ANSUL
	PK05
	5 LB
	60 B C 
	$35.00
	$35.00
	$35.00

	ANSUL
	PK10
	10 LB
	80 B C 
	$55.00
	$55.00
	$55.00

	ANSUL
	PK20
	20 LB
	120 B C
	$90.00
	$90.00
	$90.00

	Water Pressure

	ANSUL
	WO2
	2 ½  Gallon
	2-A
	$75.00
	$75.00
	$75.00

	Clean Agent FE-36

	ANSUL
	FE05
	6 LB
	5 B C
	$180.00
	$180.00
	$180.00

	ANSUL
	FE09
	10 LB
	1A 10 B C
	$240.00
	$240.00
	$240.00

	ANSUL
	FE13
	14 LB
	2 A 10 B C
	$526.00
	$526.00
	$526.00

	 K-Class  (PRICES AND SIZES TO BE SUPPLIED BY BIDDER)

	ANSUL
	KO1
	2-1/2 GAL
	1-A K
	$180.00
	$180.00
	$180.00

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	


Note:  All new fire extinguishers purchased MUST include cost of first year’s annual inspection tag and required labeling.

Total points possible

372

TERMS NET 30
DELIVERY 15 DAYS

