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City of Tulsa

Purchasing Division, 200 Civic Center

Tulsa, OK  74103

918-596-7563

Compilation Sheet, TAC 280A REVISED 07/31/2002
                 Automotive Paint and Supplies

Opening Date:  July 25, 2002



       Equipment Management Department

Section 1:  Paint

(Prices on all paint are to be bid per quart unless otherwise noted)



     Rainbow Supercolor

O’Reilly Auto Parts
Mac’s Paint & Supply

	COLOR
	ACRYLIC ENAMEL
	(CLEARCOAT)

ULTRAA 7000
	ACRYLIC ENAMEL
	(CLEARCOAT)

ULTRAA 7000
	ACRYLIC ENAMEL
	(CLEARCOAT)

ULTRAA 7000

	
Bright White
	$26.56
	$33.18
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$27.55
	$42.41

	
Oxford
	$26.56
	$33.18
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$27.55
	$42.41

	
White
	$26.56
	$33.18
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$30.86
	$42.41

	
White
	$26.56
	$33.18
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$30.86
	$42.41

	
White
	$26.56
	$33.18
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$30.86
	$42.41

	
School Bus Yellow
	$34.87
	$73.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$27.55
	$42.41

	
Wheatland
	$26.56
	$73.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$27.55
	$42.41

	
Chrome Yellow
	$26.56
	$33.18
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$27.55
	$42.41

	
Hot Red
	$34.85
	$73.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$54.23
	$87.21

	
Red Red
	No formula available
	$73.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	N/A
	N/a

	
Standard Red
	$29.21
	$73.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$37.09
	$64.94

	
Torch Red
	$29.21
	$73.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$43.85
	$87.21

	
Radiant Fire
	$29.21
	$73.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	N/a
	$87.21

	
Fire Storm
	$29.21
	$73.25
	No Bid
	No Bid
	N/a
	$87.21


1A.  PAINT (Non-Warranted or 2nd line quality)  

This list does not cover the variety of paint colors needed to do a proper refinish job.  Due to the City’s vast fleet, access to the complete color spectrum is necessary.  These colors should be available in BOTH an Acrylic Enamel and a Urethane basecoat/clearcoat system bases.



    Rainbow Supercolor
     O’Reilly Automotive

Mac’s Paint & Supply
	COLOR
	ACRYLIC ENAMEL
	(CLEARCOAT)

ULTRAA 7000
	ACRYLIC ENAMEL
	(CLEARCOAT)

ULTRAA 7000
	ACRYLIC ENAMEL
	(CLEARCOAT)

ULTRAA 7000

	
Bright White
	$19.35
	$24.56
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$24.55

	
Oxford
	$19.35
	$24.56
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$24.55

	
White
	$19.35
	$24.56
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$24.55

	
White
	$19.35
	$24.56
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$24.55

	
White
	$19.35
	$24.56
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$24.55

	School Bus Yellow
	$19.35
	$24.56
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$27.50

	
Wheatland
	$19.35
	$50.71
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$22.60

	
Chrome Yellow
	$19.35
	$24.56
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$27.50

	
Hot Red
	$29.31
	$39.04
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$33.18
	$32.60

	
Red Red
	$29.31
	$39.04
	No Bid
	No Bid
	N/a
	N/a

	
Standard Red
	$39.30
	$50.71
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$19.48
	$24.55

	
Torch Red
	$29.31
	$50.71
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$23.79
	$32.60

	
Radiant Fire
	$39.30
	$50.71
	No Bid
	No Bid
	$28.36
	$32.60

	
Fire Storm
	$29.31
	$39.04
	No Bid
	No Bid
	N/a
	N/a


Rainbow 
        O’Reilly
              Mac’s Paint

         Supercolor
      Automotive
      & Supply

	2.
PAINT PRODUCTS:
	UNIT OF

PURCHASE
	NET PRICE

(AFTER %

DISCOUNT)
	NET PRICE

(AFTER %

DISCOUNT)
	NET PRICE

(AFTER %

DISCOUNT)

	


	
	
	
	

	

Urethane clear Overall
	/gallon
	$52.17
	$46.94
	$45.30

	

Urethane clear Spot and Panel
	/gallon
	$61.32
	$46.94
	$39.33

	

Hardener
	/quart
	$37.05
	$20.58 ea.
	$28.89

	

Basecoat Stabilizer
	/gallon
	$31.38
	No Bid
	N/a

	

Clearcoat Reducer - Fast
	/gallon
	$21.08
	No Bid
	$19.07

	

Clearcoat Reducer - Med
	/gallon
	$24.34
	No Bid
	$19.07

	

Clearcoat Reducer - Slow
	/gallon
	$26.70
	No Bid
	$19.07

	

Urethane Retarder
	/qt.
	$9.32
	No Bid
	$8.96

	

Ultra Fill II - Urethane Primer
	/gallon
	$70.00
	$29.27
	$43.79

	

Reducer
	/gallon
	$20.95
	$10.71
	$19.07

	

Hardener
	/quart
	$53.79
	$16.49
	$23.49

	

White Urethane Primer (S/W)
	/gallon
	$82.67
	$102.07
	Disc.

	

Black Urethane Primer (S/W)
	/gallon
	$82.67
	$102.07
	Disc.

	

Clearcoat Urethane (S/W)
	/gallon
	$77.05
	$99.31
	$55.56


	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	Rainbow Supercolor
	O’Reilly Automotive
	Mac’s Paint & Supply

	
3.
GENERAL PAINT PRODUCTS:


	UNIT OF

PURCHASE
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT

	

Surface Cleaner
	/gallon
	$14.53
	$7.59
	$10.28

	

Universal Retarder
	/qt
	$9.32/qt
	No Bid
	$27.30

	

Reducer (medium)
	/gallon
	$17.29
	No Bid
	$19.07

	

Reducer
	/gallon
	$17.29
	No Bid
	$19.07

	

Thinner
	/5 gallon
	$19.95
	$19.58
	$23.45

	

Gray Ultra-Fill
	/gallon
	$65.12
	No Bid
	$30.88

	

Red Ultra-Fill
	/gallon
	$61.01
	No Bid
	$30.88

	

Non Penetrating thinner
	/gallon
	$16.11
	No Bid
	$7.59

	

Seal Gray
	/gallon
	$45.13
	No Bid
	$45.44

	

Q-Seal
	/gallon
	$51.71
	No Bid
	$49.52

	

Universal Flattener
	/quart
	$28.71
	$25.14
	$19.64

	

Vinyl Additive
	/quart
	$10.48
	$19.60
	Obsolete

	
          Fiberglass Reinforced Filler (S/W)
	/gallon
	$29.19
	$22.65
	$32.40

	

Solvent Cleaner (S/W)
	/gallon
	$18.13
	No Bid
	$10.28

	

Transparent Urethane Sealer
	/gallon
	$58.14
	No Bid
	$61.12

	

Acrylic Clear
	/gallon
	$58.28
	No Bid
	Obsolete

	

Fisheye 
	/pint
	$14.18
	No Bid
	$13.70

	

Multi-Flex Additive
	/pint
	$22.88
	No Bid
	$18.54

	

G.B.P. Etching Filler
	/gallon
	$86.83
	$90.24
	$50.58


       Rainbow

O’Reilly
     Mac’s Paint &

     Supercolor
        Automotive

Supply

	
4.
GENERAL SUPPLIES:



3 M or equivalent


	Unit Of Purchase
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT

	Soft Hand Block
	/pkg of 1
	$12.44
	$7.93
	$9.79

	Soft Hand Sanding Pad
	/box of 5
	$2.35
	$1.50
	$9.25

	Compound Pad 2+2
	/pkg of 1
	$17.79
	$15.13
	$18.68

	Polishing Pad 2+2
	/pkg of 1
	$18.17
	$16.44
	$20.29

	Foam Pad (2/pkg.)
	/pkg of 2
	$17.57
	$16.52
	$20.40

	Finesse-it II
	/quart
	$21.38
	$65.65
	$23.87

	Compound
	/quart
	$11.25
	$25.72
	$31.75

	Metal Glaze
	/quart
	$21.41
	$18.39
	$21.41

	Compound
	/quart
	$20.31
	$18.38
	$22.68

	Microfinish Liquid
	/quart
	$33.32/gal
	$30.13
	$11.33

	Micro Compound
	/quart
	$28.12/gal
	$25.44
	$31.40

	½” Masking Tape
	/roll
	$1.80
	$1.50
	$1.84

	¾” Masking Tape
	/roll
	$1.80
	$1.88
	$1.85


	
	Con’t.
	Rainbow

Supercolor
	O’Reilly

Automotive
	Mac’s Paint

& Supply

	2” Masking Tape
	/roll
	$5.40
	$5.03
	$4.05

	6” Masking Tape
	/roll
	$10.00
	$11.40
	$4.98

	12” Masking Paper
	/roll
	$20.00
	$22.81
	$9.38

	18” Masking Paper
	/roll
	$40.00
	$34.23
	$14.08

	Respirator Filter/Small
	/pkg of 1
	$14.78
	$12.99
	$16.03

	Respirator Filter /Med
	/pkg of 1
	$14.78
	$12.99
	$16.03

	Respirator  Filter /Lg
	/pkg of 1
	$14.78
	$12.99
	$16.03

	Weatherstrip Adhesive
	/pkg of 1
	$4.71
	$3.00
	$3.71

	Adhesive Clear
	/pkg of 1
	$5.91
	$3.77
	$4.65

	Sealer Body
	/pkg of 1
	$10.53
	$6.72
	$8.29

	Sealer Urethane
	/pkg of 1
	$11.72
	$7.47
	$9.23

	Sealer Brushable
	/pkg of 1
	$17.08
	$15.44
	$14.03

	7” Disc
	/box of 20
	Obsolete
	N/A
	N/a

	Rocker Schultz
	/can (qt.)
	$15.31
	$13.85
	$17.04

	Scuff Pad
	/box of 20
	$13.98
	$11.60
	$12.54

	Scuff Pad
	/box of 20
	$13.98
	$11.60
	$12.54

	Marson disposable Wheel covers
	/box
	$29.00
	$21.42/125 per box
	$29.00

	Plastic Sheeting
	/roll
	$26.77
	$19.03/12 ft. box
	$25.97/350’ roll

	Aerosol Undercoat
	/can
	$3.20/16 oz. can
	$2.64
	$3.76

	Fiberglass Matting
	/pkg
	$5.56
	$10.34
	$5.56

	Razor Blades
	/box
	$6.50
	$3.00
	$5.71

	Filler Spreaders
	/pkg
	$1.62
	$0.16
	$1.37

	Rubber Squeegees
	each
	$2.09
	$0.55
	$1.46

	Dyna-Weld DY-662
	each
	$19.70
	$11.49
	$19.70

	Marson Whitefill M-1278
	/cartridge
	$53.34
	$40.31
	$51.15

	Latex Gloves
	/box
	$7.34
	$4.86
	$12.00

	Tack Cloths
	/pkg
	$10.00
	$0.57 ea
	$11.76/12 ct. pkg.

	Curved Cheese Graters
	each
	$2.07
	$1.54
	$2.10

	Body filler Creme Hardener (4 oz. Tubes)
	/tube
	$2.10
	$1.79
	$2.13

	Cut-Off Wheels/Spot Weld Cutters
	/each
	$1.28
	$0.82
	$2.00

	White, non-bleed paper 12”
	/roll
	$12.72
	$13.63
	$15.72

	White, non-bleed paper 18”
	/roll
	$17.25
	$20.45
	$24.78

	White, non-bleed paper 36”
	/roll
	$34.71
	$40.92
	$43.74

	Weld/Spark resistant paper 24”
	/roll
	$55.03
	$35.89
	$61.43

	Norton body adhesive system
	/tube
	$5.80
	$22.38
	$27.92

	
	
	
	
	


  Rainbow 
  
     O’Reilly
           Mac’s Paint

   Supercolor
  Automotive
  & Supply
	
5.
SANDPAPER:



3 M or equivalent


	UNIT OF

PURCHASE
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT
	NET PRICE
(AFTER %

DISCOUNT

	280  Grit

240  Grit

180 Grit

120 Grit

80 Grit

40 Grit

80 Grit

40 Grit

320 Grit

1000 Grit

1200 Grit

1500 Grit

800 Grit

400 Grit

600 Grit

100 Grit

80 Grit

36 Grit

40 Grit

80 Grit

40 Grit

80 Grit

180 Grit

100 Grit
	6” Disc (DA)
	/roll of 175 discs
	$58.94
	$53.30
	$23.19

	
	6” Disc
	/roll of 175 discs
	$58.94
	$53.30
	$23.19

	
	6” Disc
	/roll of 175 discs
	$58.94
	$53.30
	$23.19

	
	6” Disc
	/roll of 125 discs
	$42.10
	$38.07
	$23.19

	
	6” Disc
	/roll of 125 discs
	$45.57
	$41.22
	$26.70

	
	6” Disc
	/box of 100
	$80.37
	$73.00
	$40.82

	
	8” Disc
	/box of 50
	$58.25
	$52.50
	$29.86

	
	8” Disc
	/box of 150
	$72.76
	$66.00
	$59.12

	
	Wet/Dry
	/sleeve of 50pc
	$24.77
	$22.50
	$20.53

	
	Wet/Dry
	/sleeve of 50pc
	$18.17
	$16.50
	$16.06

	
	Wet/Dry

5-1/2 x 9”
	/sleeve of 50pc
	$18.17
	$16.50
	$16.06

	
	Wet/Dry
	/sleeve of 50pc
	$18.17
	$16.50
	$16.06

	
	Wet/Dry
	/sleeve of 50pc
	$23.66
	$21.50
	$20.53

	
	Wet/Dry
	/sleeve of 50pc
	$23.66
	$21.50
	$20.53

	
	Wet/Dry
	/sleeve of 50pc
	$23.66
	$21.50
	$20.53

	
	Sheet
	/box of 200
	$48.12
	$44.00
	$14.71

	
	Air File
	/box of 100
	$35.51
	$32.00
	$18.13

	
	Air File
	/box of 100
	$52.42
	$48.00
	$26.76

	
	Air File
	/box of 100
	$41.80
	$48.00
	$23.91

	
	2” Stick-it
	/box of 100
	$44.91
	$41.00
	$19.52

	
	2” Stick-it
	/box of 100
	$60.47
	$54.00
	$30.84

	
	2” Sheet
	/sleeve of 100
	$36.35
	$34.00
	$15.95

	
	Stikit Gold
	/135’ roll
	$28.64
	$25.90
	$31.18

	
	Stikit Gold
	/90’ roll
	$28.64
	$25.90
	$31.18


If you have questions or comments concerning this bid compilation, please contact Patricia Cummings by phone at 918-596-7561 or by E-Mail at pcummings@ci.tulsa.ok.us.
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