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City of Tulsa

Purchasing Division, 200 Civic Center

Tulsa, OK  74103

918-596-7563

Compilation Sheet









TAC 565

Curbed & Uncurbed Arterial Streets, Miscellaneous Sites, Medians & Inter-State Outparcel Mowing

Public Works Department




Opening Date:  May 30, 2002






        Area 1            Area 2             Area 3              A1          A2            A3

TruGreen LandCare
No Bid
No Bid
$10,608.75
$38.00
$45.00
$29.00

Fifth Season, Inc.
No Bid
$25,760.00
No Bid
$75.00
$25.00
$25.00

Complete Household Service, Inc.
$19,861.00
$42,715.00
No Bid
$27.00
$24.00
$18.00

Lot Maintenance of Oklahoma
$23,084.00
$31,669.00
$10,890.00
$32.00
$52.00
$27.00

If you have questions or comments concerning this bid compilation, please contact Patricia Cummings by phone at 918-596-7561 or by E-Mail at pcummings@ci.tulsa.ok.us.
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