	City of Tulsa Purchasing Division - Bid Summary       

        Bid: Tac 456A

        Description:Amrel laptops and related equipment




	

	
	Amrel Systems, Inc.
	GVT Marketing
	Horizon Comm Sales Company, Inc.
	Custom Fit, Inc.
	Wareforce
	Comtrend

	Item
	Qty
	Description


	Total
	Total
	Total
	Total
	Total
	Total

	1
	500
	Rocky II+ mobile laptop
	$ 2168740.00
	$ 2741200.00
	$ 2554300.00
	$ 2966000.00
	$ 2865800.00
	$ 2713000.00

	2
	500
	Rocky II+ docking station for vehicle use
	$  199750.00
	$ 223250.00
	$ 220900.00
	$ 246500.00
	$ 230300.00
	$ 222500.00

	
	
	Options as needed by the City
	
	
	
	
	
	

	3
	50
	CD Roms
	$  $ 13775.00
	$ 14137.50
	$  14065.00
	$ 14800.00
	$  14355.00
	$ 4100.00

	4
	5
	DVD drive
	$ 2945.00
	$ 3022.50
	$ 3007.00
	$ 3150.00
	$  3069.00
	$ 4850.00

	5
	50
	Spare battery
	$ 11875.00
	$ 12187.50
	$ 12125.00
	$ 12650.00
	$ 12375.00
	$ 2950.00

	6
	10
	Docking station for office use
	$ 3990.00
	$ 4095.00
	$ 4074.00
	$ 4270.00
	$ 4158.00
	$ 4350.00

	7
	10
	Factory documentation and service manual
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 1990.00

	8
	5
	Software and hardware for diagnostic testing
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 1195.00

	9
	3
	Technical service class at vendor site
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 7500.00
	$ 0.00
	$ 279.00

	10
	500
	4 year limited warranty
	$ 217000.00
	$ 217000.00
	$ 217000.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	11
	500
	5  year limited warranty
	$ 260000.00
	$ 260000.00
	$ 260000.00
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


       Prepared by:  Bill Youngblodd                                

